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DATE: FEBRUARY 16, 2010 AT 2:15 P.M.
LOCATION: LARGE CONFERENCE ROOM
PROJECT NO. 02-10-C15-69 REPAVING SERVICES 2009-2010

HIP HOT IN PLACE PAVING,
CUTLER REPAVING, INC. LLC
LAWRENCE, KS ST. PETERSBURG, FL
BIDDERS EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
BASE BID
RECYCLING:; Section
2616-1.01A-c 412,387 5% $2.35 $969,109.45
REJUVENATOR 30,929 GAL $3.05 $94,333.45
CURB MILLING 242,591 LF $1.90 $460,922.90
LANE MILLING; 12 FT
LANE 17,000 LF $2.50 $42,500.00
ADJUST MANHOLES TO N N
GRADE 120 EA $235.00 $28,200.00
ADJUST WATER VALVES &
MONITOR WELLS TO O O
GRADE 85 EA $150.00 $12,750.00
6' VALLEY GUTTER 100 LF $63.10 $6,310.00
10' VALLEY GUTTER 320 LF $103.25 $33,040.00
12' VALLEY GUTTER 120 LF $126.20 $15,144.00
14" VALLEY GUTTER 130 LF $144.25 $18,752.50

REMOVE EXISTING
VALLEY GUTTER OR CURB

& GUTTER 1,545 LF $16.00 $24,720.00
CURB & GUTTER 875 LF $28.40 $24,850.00
FULL DEPTH

SCARIFICATION WITH 3%
LIME STABILIZATION AND

1.5" OVERLAY 7,150 SY $32.75 $234,162.50

6" DEPTH MILLING W/ 1.5"
OVERLAY, ASPHALT

PROVIDED BY P&D 350 % $4.00 $1,400.00
TOTAL BASE BID $1,966,194.80
PROJECT NO. 1 - ALTERNATE BID NO. 1
HOT MIX 30,305 TON $68.50 $2,075,892.50 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID $2,075,892.50 NO BID
PROJECT NO. 2 - FULL DEPTH RECYLCING OF STREETS
RECYCLING: SECTION
2616-1.01A - A 38,200 % NO BID NO BID $9.50 $362,900.00
REJUVENATOR 2.865 GAL NO BID NO BID $6.60 $18,909.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID 2 NO BID $381,809.00
ADDENDUM #1 ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED
ADDENDUM #2 ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED
BID BOND BID BOND BID BOND
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