PROJECT NO. 02-10-IPQ07 SERVICE CONTRACT FOR GROUNDS MAINTENANCE

/]

D/L FEBRUARY 19, 2010 AT 4:00 P.M.

CITY OF

McALLEN

SUBMITTAL)

C. IRRIGATION REPAIRS, PLANT REPLACEMENT AND

OTHER REPAIRS TO BE PAID AS EXTRA SERVICES, PER
OCCURANCE, AFTER SUBMITTAL ON COSTS AND
AUTHORIZATION TO PROCEED FROM THE CITY (PER

RGV LANDSCAPE ART & MALDONADO'S NURSERY & VALLEY GARDEN CENTER DBA
DESIGN LLC <> LAWN CARE EXPERTS, INC. AMIGO GROUNDS CAR LANDSCAPE TCMS, INC. LOPEZ NURSERY SOUTHERN LANDSCAPES
BIDDERS: DONNA, TX EDINBURG, TX MCALLEN, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX - DONNA, TX MCALLEN, TX MCALLEN, TX
EST.SQ
FTIN | NO.OF
1,000 SQ | CYCLES EST. SQFT IN| TOTAL COST EST. SQFT IN| TOTAL COST EST. SQFT IN| TOTAL COST EST. SQFT IN| TOTAL COST EST. SQFT IN| TOTAL COST EST. SQFT IN| TOTAL COST EST. SQFT IN| TOTAL COST
LOCATION FT | PERYR|UNITPRICE| 1,000SQFT | PERYR |UNITPRICE| 1,000SQFT | PERYR |UNITPRICE| 1,000SQFT | PERYR |UNITPRICE[ 1,000SQFT| PERYR |UNITPRICE| 1,000SQFT | PERYR |UNITPRICE| 1,000SQFT | PERYR |UNITPRICE| 1,000SQFT | PERYR
[BID ITEM #1 - MOWING AND TRIMMING SERVICES
RONEY BOYS & GIRLS CLUB 182 26 $0.54 $98.28]  $2,555.28 $1.65| $30030]  $7,807.80 $1.00 $182.00]  $4,732.00 $1.96 $356.72]  $9,274.72 $2.99 $544.18]  $14,148.68 $2.93 $533.26]  $13,864.76 $3.60 $655.20]  $17,035.20
INTERNATIONAL BRIDGE 94 26 $1.59 $149.46]  $3,885.96 NO BID $1.00 $94.00]  $2,444.00 $2.61 $245.34  $6,378.84 $4.35 $408.90]  $10,631.40 $4.65 $437.10]  $11,364.60 $4.20 $394.80]  $10,264.80
[BID ITEM #2 - LANDSCAPE BED MAINTENANCE SERVICES
RONEY BOYS & GIRLS CLUB B 26 $80.00B $2,080.00]  $150.00 $3,900.00 $150.00B $3,900.00 $148.SOB $3,861.00 $140.00B $3,640.00 $225.00B $5,850.00 $190.00@
INTERNATIONAL BRIDGE 26 $80.00 $2,080.00 NO BID $100.00 $2,600.00 $80.00 $2,080.00 $41.00 $1,066.000  $200.00 $5,200.00]  $190.00 $4,940.00
|BID ITEM #3 - LITTER AND DEBRIS REMOVAL
RONEY BOYS & GIRLS CLUB 182 26 $0.05 $9.10 $236.60 $0.55| $10010]  $2,602.60 $1.10 $200.20]  $5,205.20 $0.26 $47.32]  $1,230.32 $0.24 $4368]  $1,135.68 $0.30 $54.60]  $1,419.60 $0.25 $4550]  $1,183.00
INTERNATIONAL BRIDGE 50 26 $0.40 $20.00 $520.00 NO BID $1.10 $55.00]  $1,430.00 $0.26 $13.00 $338.00 $0.24 $12.00) $312.00 $0.90 $45.00]  $1,170.00 $0.75 $37.50 $975.00
|BID ITEM #4 - LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION SYSTEM MANAGEMENT
MCALLEN/REYNOSA INTERNATIONAL
BRIDGE 50 1 $12.00 $600.00 $600.00 NO BID $40.00]  $2,000.00]  $2,000.00 $36.00]  $1,800.00|  $1,800.00 $34.95|  $1,74750|  $1,747.50 $48.00]  $2,400.00]  $2,400.00 $40.00]  $2,000.00]  $2,000.00
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS $11,957.84 $14,310.40f $22,311.20f $24,962.88 $32,681.26 $41,268.99 $41,338.00
|BID ITEM #5 - EXTRA SERVICES
A. MULCHING AROUND TREES & SHRUBS (LABOR ONLY)
(PER TREE/SHRUB) $0.65 $3.00 $10.00 $1.17 $1.25 $2.99 $3.00
B. AERATING LAWN AND TURF AREAS (PER 1,000 SQ FT) $17.00 $1.00 $10.00 $7.00 $5.00 $6.25 $6.00

ORGV LANDSCAPE ART & DESIGN LLC - BID ITEM #1, FOR RONEY BOYS & GIRLS CLUB, SUBMITTED TOTAL $2,600.00, CORRECT AMOUNT IS $2,555.28; FOR INTERNATIONAL BRIDGE SUBMITTED TOTAL $3,900.00, CORRECT AMOUNT IS $3,885.96; BID ITEM #3, FOR RONEY BOYS & GIRLS CLUB, SUBMITTED TOTAL $260.00, CORRECT AMOUNT IS $236.60.
A AMIGO GROUND CARE - BID ITEM #1 FOR RONEY BOYS & GIRLS CLUB, SUBMITTED TOTAL $4,722.00, CORRECT AMOUNT IS $4,732.00

- MALDONADO'S NURSERY & LANDSCAPE - BID ITEM #3, FOR RONEY BOYS & GIRLS CLUB SUBMITTED TOTAL $12,303.20, CORRECT AMOUNT IS $1,230.32; FOR INTERNATIONAL BRIDGE SUBMITTED TOTAL $3,380.00, CORRECT AMOUNT IS $338.00
.VALLEY GARDEN CENTER DBA SOUTHERN LANDSCAPES - BID ITEM #4, SUBMITTED TOTAL $2,250.00, CORRECT AMOUNT IS $2,000.00
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