
PROJECT NO.      02-10-P17-121  PURCHASE OF FF&E FOR NORTH POLICE COMMUNITY TRAINING CENTER

 PAGE 1 CHAIRS - (ROOMS - 105-112,114-120,131-132,143-144)

1 Relate Side Std Uph Back/Glides/Arms. Dimensions H33 1/2" W24 1/2" D21 1/2" AllSteel
RLM-UGO 
Relate 45 EA

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 4 WEEKS $128.96 $5,803.20 SIT ON IT FREELANCE

LIMITED 
LIFETIME

4 TO 5 
WEEKS $178.40 $8,028.00

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $125.00 $5,625.00 TV455 NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED $134.45 $6,050.25 SIT ON IT - FREELANCE 5214

PAGE 2 DESK - (ROOMS - 105-109,111-112,114-120,131-132,143-144)

2

Freestanding 30DX291/2H End Panel Support - 2 EA, Full-Height 29-1/2Hx66W Modesty Panel - 
1 EA, Persona 28- 1/8Hx23-3/8D Support Ped FF Int Pull - 1 EA, Persona 28-1/8Hx23-3/8D 
Support Ped BBF Int Pull - 1 EA, Primary 30Dx66W T-Mold Eg Lam w/Gromments - 1 EA AllSteel Various

18 UNITS LIMITED 
LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $604.36 $10,878.48 GLOBAL SD SERIES

LIMITED 
LIFETIME

4 TO 5 
WEEKS $684.82 $12,326.76

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $550.00 $9,900.00 ZFRD3066.F PSP6612 20 YEARS 30 DAYS $760.60 $13,690.80 GLOBAL

PAGE 3 FILING CABINET - (FILE ROOM - 136)

3
Persona Lateral File., Dimensions:  Persona Lateral File 64-3/4H 36W 12" RO 4-12" Drw Int. Pu
(1),Counterweight Kit - (1) 

PLF536NI & 
LFA-CW 6 EA

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $522.72 $3,136.32 GLOBAL 9300P

LIMITED 
LIFETIME

4 TO 5 
WEEKS $719.88 $4,319.28

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $575.00 $3,450.00 PSLAT536 20 YEARS 30 DAYS $653.70 $3,922.20 GLOBAL

PAGE 4 - TABLES (MEETING ROOM - 141)

4
Simple Training Table Available with fixed or folding legs & an optional flipping top, Saturn 
Rectangular Folding C-Leg Table 29"H x 24"D x 60"W 04278L 18 EA

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $395.63 $7,121.34 VERSTEEL 10 YEARS

4 TO 6 
WEEKS $424.72 $7,644.96

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $315.00 $5,670.00 RTFLDT2460.G.L.NN

NOT 
SPECIFIED

NOT 
SPECIFIED $447.44 $8,053.92 NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED $464.72 $8,364.96 FIXTURES 04278L

PAGE 5 - TABLES W/MODESTY PANEL (TRAINING ROOM - 123)

5
Simple Training Table Available with fixed or folding legs and an optional flipping top, to include 
modesty panel, Saturn Rectangular Folding C-Leg Table 29"H x 24"D x 60"W 04278L 15 EA

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $395.63 $5,934.45 VERSTEEL 10 YEARS

4 TO 6 
WEEKS $519.06 $7,785.90

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $367.00 $5,505.00 TFLDT2460.G.L.NN,MO

NOT 
SPECIFIED

NOT 
SPECIFIED $643.77 $9,656.55 NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED $632.96 $9,494.40 FIXTURES 04278L

PAGE 6 - CHAIRS (OFFICE, TRAINING, CONFERENCE, RECEPTION 105-109,11-120,123-124,131-132,134-135,140,143,144)

6 MALAGA-High Back Pneumatic Tilter w/arms & fixed back  -OFFICE Global 3140-4 83 EA
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $299.40 $24,850.20
LIMITED 

LIFETIME
3 TO 5 

WEEKS $321.22 $26,661.26
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $218.00 $18,094.00 TP021.5
NOT 

SPECIFIED
NOT 

SPECIFIED $359.42 $29,831.86 25 YEARS 30 DAYS $294.90 $24,476.70

PAGE 7 - CHAIRS (TRAINING ROOM 145)

7 Charger High Back, Multi - Task Armless - Zoom Global DA46200 49 EA LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $330.90 $16,214.10
LIMITED 

LIFETIME
3 TO 5 

WEEKS $353.28 $17,310.72
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $184.00 $9,016.00 TP011.5
NOT 

SPECIFIED
NOT 

SPECIFIED $346.87 $16,996.63 MANF. ZOOM 10 YEARS
30-45 
DAYS $382.80 $18,757.20 NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED $372.98 $18,276.02

PAGE 8 - CONFERENCE TABLE (TRAINING ROOM 124)

8
Adaptabilities Board Room - A445PB -  2 EA, A2488PB - 1 EA, A3672RE -  2 EA, A48120RE - 
1 EA Global Various 1 UNIT

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $1,735.57 $1,735.57

25 YEAR 
LIMITED

4 TO 5 
WEEKS $1,543.56 $1,543.56

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $1,026.00 $1,026.00 ZFRECT3672

NOT 
SPECIFIED

NOT 
SPECIFIED $1,900.98 $1,900.98 10 YEARS 30 DAYS $2,691.00 $2,691.00 HIGH PRESS. LAM

PAGE 9 - CONFERENCE TABLE (TRAINING ROOMS 134 & 140)

9 Adaptabilities Boardroom Tables, A2445PB - 1 EA, A4896B - 1 EA   1 UNIT LIMITED 
LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $519.49 $519.49

25 YEAR 
LIMITED

4 TO 5 
WEEKS $508.50 $508.50 GLOBAL/VARIOUS

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $413.00 $413.00 ZFRECT4896

NOT 
SPECIFIED

NOT 
SPECIFIED $568.97 $568.97 10 YEARS 30 DAYS $743.70 $743.70 HIGH PRESS. LAM

10 YEARS 30 DAYS $675.50 $675.50 LOW PRESS. LAM
$1,000.20 $1,000.20 HIGH PRESS. LAM

PAGE 10 - FOLDING CHAIRS (MEETING ROOM 141)

11 Deluxe Fabric Padded Seat and Folding Back Chair Samsonite 60-885 36 EA 5 YEAR 4 WEEKS $46.50 $1,674.00 5 YEAR LIMITED
3 TO 5 

WEEKS $53.00 $1,908.00
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $38.00 $1,368.00
NOT 

SPECIFIED
NOT 

SPECIFIED $39.07 $1,406.52

PAGE 11 - GANG SEATING (LOBBY  ROOM 101)

12 Paxton 3 Seat, PA3272-ST-3, PA3272-ST-2   2 UNITS 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS $2,053.00 $4,106.00 3 YEARS
4 TO 6 

WEEKS $2,170.00 $4,340.00 BENCHMARK/VARIOUS
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 4 WEEKS $868.00 $1,736.00 C224-3
NOT 

SPECIFIED
NOT 

SPECIFIED $4,821.66 $9,643.32

PAGE 12 - TIER TABLES (LOBBY ROOM 145)

13 Tier Tables 1 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS $13,840.25 $13,840.25 10 YEARS
4 TO 6 

WEEKS $15,050.56 $15,050.56 VERSTEEL/QUOTE HM1079-5
Left end Tier Bases No Modesty 10 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
Right End Tier Bases NO Modesty 10 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
Intermediate Tier Bases No Modesty 20 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
Intermediate Ada Height No Modesty 3 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
Left end ADA Height No Modesty 1 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
Right End ADA Height No Modesty 1 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
SQ. PL Bases 20 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
SQ. ADA PL Bases 3 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
Henri Units 34 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
Mending Plates 21 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00
ADA Tables 2 EA 10 YEAR 6 WEEKS INCLUDED INCLUDED $0.00

PAGE 13 - CHAIR DOLLY 

14 4-Wheel Dolly 3 EA 10 YEAR 4 WEEKS $448.24 $1,344.72 VERSTEEL 10 YEARS $456.46 $1,369.38 FIXTURES
NOT 

SPECIFIED
NOT 

SPECIFIED $480.77 $1,442.31 NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED $476.46 $1,429.38

PAGE 14 - SEATING (BREAKROOM 138)

15 Seating:  Nimble High Density Stacker/Chrome Frame AllSteel 4 EA
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 4 WEEKS $41.89 $167.56 SIT ON IT ROWDY
LIMITED 

LIFETIME $50.06 $200.24
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $55.00 $220.00 TV300 NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED $47.47 $189.88 SIT ON IT 92SB

PAGE 15 - TABLE (BREAKROOM 138)

16 30" Sq Top Lam, T-mold Edg. X base med, Fixed Hgt, Standing w/Glides
ALA30SQR & 
ABX27FGU 1 EA 10 YEAR 5 WEEKS $259.43 $259.43 VERSTEEL

LIMITED 
LIFETIME $260.59 $260.59 ALLSTEEL

LIMITED 
LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $207.00 $207.00 SQTT30.GL

        The Exceptional Home Center - Total submitted on bid form is $63,071.00.  Grand Total should be $62,919.00. (Miscalculation on Item No. 11, Did not change quantity as per Addendum #1.)

         G.L. Seaman & Company - Did not submit proposal on Revised Bid Form.  Did not submit a total on Bid Form.  Total as per quote attached to bid form is $81,306.67.  Grand Total should be $80,853.72.                         

         Office Furniture Interiors, Inc. - Total submitted on bid form is $65,351.80.  Grand Total should be $64,957.10. Submitted alternate product/price on Item No. 10.                         

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$689.00 ZFRECT48120
25 YEAR 
LIMITED

4 TO 5 
WEEKS $700.40 $700.40

$62,919.00

10 $1,352.66 $1,352.66
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 5 WEEKS $715.53 $715.53

$98,300.64

WORKPLACE RESOURCE LLP
MCALLEN, TX

WARRANTY ARO UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
AMT BID

ALTERNATE 
PRODUCT 

UNIT

NO BID

NO BID

ALTERNATE PRODUCTGLOBAL/VARIOUS
NOT 

SPECIFIED
NOT 

SPECIFIED
LIMITED 

LIFETIME 3 WEEKS $689.00Adaptabilities Boardroom Tables, A48120B - 1 EA, A2488PB -  1 EA
1

NOT SUBMITTED
NOT ACKNOWLEDGED

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NOT ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED

DC INTERIORS
SAN ANTONIO, TX

WARRANTY ARO UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMT 
BID

ALTERNATE PRODUCT 

$43,804.89
CASHIER'S CHECK
ACKNOWLEDGED

BID BOND
ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED

JONES & COOK STATIONERS
EDINBURG, TX

G.L. SEAMAN & COMPANY
CARROLLTON, TX
TX-MAS 3-7111010

THE EXCEPTIONAL HOME 
CENTER

MCALLEN, TX
WARRANTY ARO UNIT 

PRICE
TOTAL 

AMT BID
ALTERNATE 
PRODUCT 

CASHIER'S CHECK

OFFICE FURNITURE 
INTERIORS, INC.

MCALLEN, TX
QTY

BIDDERS

$109,958.11 $80,853.72 $64,957.10

NO BID

BID BOND
GRAND TOTAL ALL ITEMS

ADDENDUM #1

WARRANTY ARO UNIT 
PRICE

MANF. ALTERNATE PRODUCT MODEL# WARRANTY TOTAL 
AMT BID

ITEM 
NO.

ARO UNIT 
PRICE

DESCRIPTION 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

TOTAL 
AMT BID

ALTERNATE 
PRODUCT 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

CITY OF McALLEN
BID TABULATION

FEBRUARY 15, 2010 AT 11:00 A.M.

CASHIER'S CHECK

TOTAL 
AMT BID

ALTERNATE 
PRODUCT 

WARRANTY ARO UNIT 
PRICE

NOT SUBMITTED
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