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PROJECT NO: 06-11-IPQ31-23 Car Wash Service Contract

LEO'S MOBILE AUTO SPA HAND
OASIS ONE CAR WASH M6 33 FACILITY SERVICES CAR WASH

BIDDERS MCALLEN, TX SAN JUAN, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX MCALLEN, TX
ITEM NO. 1-STANDARD SEDAN (POLICE OR CIVILIAN)
CARWASH | stsof si00f sio0f NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $9.00 $12.00 $23.00 $15.99
ITEM NO. 2-STANDARD S.U.V.'S
CARWASH | stsof soof s00f NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $9.00 $15.00 $34.00 $18.99
ITEM NO. 3-EXTENDED SIZE S.U.V.'S
CARWASH | stsof soof sl NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $9.00 $15.00 $39.00 $22.99
ITEM NO. 4-PICK--UPS
CARWASH | stsof soof sao0f NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $9.00 $15.00 $29.00 $18.99
ITEM NO. 5-MOTOR HOMES
CARWASH | ssso0  _ssool o seoof NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $45.00 $45.00 $124.00 $99.99
ITEM NO. 6-K---9 VEHICLES
CARWASH | stsof soof s00| NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $9.00 $20.00 $34.00 $26.99
ITEM NO. 7-MINI VANS
CARWASH | stsof soof so00f NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $9.00 $15.00 $34.00 $18.99
ITEM NO. 8-FULL SIZE VANS
CARWASH | stsof siso0f sl NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $9.00 $20.00 $40.00 $22.99
ITEM NO. 9-EXTENDED VANS
CARWASH | s s7so| _ __swsool  sso0l NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $9.00 $20.00 $40.00 $26.99
ITEM NO. 10-BUS (26 PASSENGER)
CARWASH | s2500 _swoool  smsoof NO BID
CAR WASH AND VACUUM $35.00 $40.00 $99.00 $69.99
o v o
COMPLETE CAR IS REQUIRED WE ARE ABLE TO ADD AN
WASH/VACUUM SERVICE CAR'S AND SUV'S ~ 30 MIN, ADDITIONAL CREW MEMBER FOR
FROM TIME OF ARRIVAL NOT SPECIFIED MOTOR HOME ~ 1 HR QUICKER SERVICE 1 HOUR PER UNIT
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