
BIDDERS:
ADDENDUM #1
ADDENDUM #2
ADDENDUM #3
PESTICIDE APPLICATION 
LICENSE
NUMBER OF EMPLOYEES
LIST OF EQUIPMENT
HISTORY
REFERENCES
MOWING AND TRIMMING 
SERVICES (to be used in future 
sites) (UNIT PRICE PER 1000 SQ. 
FT.)

CONTRACT #1 MOWING AND 
TRIMMING SERVICES                               

EST. SQ. 
FT. P/1000

NO.      
CYCLES

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
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FT TOTAL TOTAL COST
CONTRACTOR 

TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
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FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
UNIT PRICE 

PER 1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST
CONTRACTO

R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
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PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST
CONTRACTO

R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
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PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST
CONTRACTO

R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST
CONTRACTOR 

TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 

1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

2ND STREET TRAIL EXCLUDING 
THE SUBDIVISION FRONTS 4556 26 $0.53 $2,414.68 $62,781.68 $2,453.85 $63,800.00 $0.60 $2,733.60 $71,073.60 $0.90 $4,100.40 $106,610.40 $0.58 $2,642.48 $68,704.48 $67,704.48 $0.45 $2,050.20 $53,305.20 $0.36 $1,640.16 $42,644.16 $0.55 $2,505.80 $65,150.80 $1.98 $9,020.88 $234,542.88 $9,030.10 $234,782.64 $0.62 $2,824.72 $73,442.72

Not Submitted
Not Submitted

No Bid

BID OPENING: July 22, 2010 at 2:00 p.m.
LOCATION:  Conference Room

RODRIGUEZ LAWN CARE
McALLEN, TX
Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Acknowledged

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted

Acknowledged

 Submitted Application Only Dated 07/08/2010
Not Submitted
Not Submitted

Did not include with proposal
Submitted

PROJECT NO.:  07-10-S42-76 SERVICE CONTRACT FOR GROUND MAINTENANCE 2010

VALLEY GARDEN CENTER                                 
MCALLEN, TX
Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Not Submitted
Submitted
Submitted

$1.60

AG III CONTRACTORS
SAN BENITO, TX
Acknowledged
Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Submitted
Not Submitted

Not Submitted
Not Submitted

$2.00

OASIS IRRIGATION AND LANDSCAPE
MCALLEN, TX 
Acknowledged
Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted

Not Submitted
Submitted

$0.90

TLC TOTAL LAWN CARE
MCALLEN, TX
Acknowledged
Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted

$2.50

LOPEZ NURSERY
MCALLEN, TX

Not Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Not Acknowledged

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted

Not Submitted
Submitted

No Bid

LAWN CARE EXPERTS
EDINBURG, TX
Acknowledged
Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Did not include with proposal

Did not include with proposal
Did not include with proposal
Did not include with proposal

$3.00

INNOVATIVE ENVIRONMENTS 
MCALLEN, TX
Acknowledged
Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted

$2.75

MALDONADO NURSERY & LANDSCAPING                    
LA FERIA, TX
Acknowledged
Acknowledged
Acknowledged

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted

$0.78

BICENTENNIAL 2711 26 $0.54 $1,463.94 $38,062.44 $1,480.77 $38,500.02 $0.65 $1,762.15 $45,815.90 $0.90 $2,439.90 $63,437.40 $0.58 $1,572.38 $40,881.88 $40,881.88 $0.45 $1,219.95 $31,718.70 $0.42 $1,138.62 $29,604.12 $29,594.50 $0.60 $1,626.60 $42,291.60 $40,684.80 $1.98 $5,367.78 $139,562.28 $0.62 $1,680.82 $43,701.32

GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #1) $100,844.12 $102,300.02 $116,889.50 $170,047.80 $109,586.36 $108,586.36 $85,023.90 $72,248.28 $72,238.66 $107,442.40 $105,835.60 $374,105.16 $374,344.92 $117,144.04
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TRIMMING SERVICES
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R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
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FERN BLVD 12 26 $0.09 $1.08 $28.08 $108.00 $2,808.00 $3.30 $39.60 $1,029.60 $3.50 $42.00 $1,092.00 $2.90 $34.80 $904.80 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20 $3.00 $36.00 $936.00 $2.00 $24.00 $624.00 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20
GALVESTON 12 26 $0.34 $4.08 $106.08 $40.80 $1,060.80 $2.50 $30.00 $780.00 $3.50 $42.00 $1,092.00 $2.90 $34.80 $904.80 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20 $3.00 $36.00 $936.00 $2.15 $25.80 $670.80 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20
LUCILLE 12 26 $0.63 $7.56 $196.56 $75.60 $1,965.60 $2.50 $30.00 $780.00 $3.50 $42.00 $1,092.00 $2.90 $34.80 $904.80 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20 $3.00 $36.00 $936.00 $2.17 $26.04 $677.04 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20
ROSE ELLEN 18 26 $0.05 $0.90 $23.40 $90.00 $2,340.00 $2.00 $36.00 $936.00 $3.50 $63.00 $1,638.00 $2.90 $52.20 $1,357.20 $2.50 $45.00 $1,170.00 $3.00 $54.00 $1,404.00 $2.17 $39.06 $1,015.56 $0.60 $10.80 $280.80
WESTWAY 30 26 $0.83 $24.90 $647.40 $249.00 $6,474.00 $2.00 $60.00 $1,560.00 $1.50 $45.00 $1,170.00 $2.90 $87.00 $2,262.00 $2.50 $75.00 $1,950.00 $3.00 $90.00 $2,340.00 $2.17 $65.10 $1,692.60 $0.60 $18.00 $468.00
7TH STREET 24 26 $0.40 $9.60 $249.60 $96.00 $2,496.00 $2.00 $48.00 $1,248.00 $2.50 $60.00 $1,560.00 $2.90 $69.60 $1,809.60 $2.50 $60.00 $1,560.00 $3.00 $72.00 $1,872.00 $2.00 $48.00 $1,248.00 $0.60 $14.40 $374.40
8TH STREET 12 26 $1.09 $13.08 $340.08 $130.80 $3,400.80 $3.00 $36.00 $936.00 $3.50 $42.00 $1,092.00 $2.90 $34.80 $904.80 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20 $3.50 $42.00 $1,092.00 $2.00 $24.00 $624.00 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20
15TH STREET 36 26 $0.84 $30.24 $786.24 $302.40 $7,862.40 $2.00 $72.00 $1,872.00 $1.50 $54.00 $1,404.00 $2.90 $104.40 $2,714.40 $2.00 $72.00 $1,872.00 $3.00 $108.00 $2,808.00 $2.15 $77.40 $2,012.40 $0.60 $21.60 $561.60
MARTIN BLVD. 20 26 $0.04 $0.80 $20.80 $80.00 $2,080.00 $2.00 $40.00 $1,040.00 $2.50 $50.00 $1,300.00 $2.90 $58.00 $1,508.00 $2.50 $50.00 $1,300.00 $3.00 $60.00 $1,560.00 $2.00 $40.00 $1,040.00 $0.60 $12.00 $312.00 $240.00
CAMELIA CIRCLE 9 26 $0.28 $2.52 $65.52 $25.20 $655.20 $3.00 $27.00 $702.00 $4.50 $40.50 $1,053.00 $2.90 $26.10 $678.60 $3.00 $27.00 $702.00 $3.00 $27.00 $702.00 $2.15 $19.35 $503.10 $0.60 $5.40 $140.40
GARDENIA CIRCLE 10 26 $0.05 $0.50 $13.00 $50.00 $1,300.00 $2.50 $25.00 $650.00 $4.50 $45.00 $1,170.00 $2.90 $29.00 $754.00 $3.00 $30.00 $780.00 $3.00 $30.00 $780.00 $2.15 $21.50 $559.00 $0.60 $6.00 $156.00
QUINCE CIRCLE 7 26 $0.05 $0.35 $9.10 $35.00 $910.00 $3.50 $24.50 $637.00 $4.50 $31.50 $819.00 $2.90 $20.30 $527.80 $3.50 $24.50 $637.00 $3.00 $21.00 $546.00 $2.30 $16.10 $418.60 $0.60 $4.20 $109.20 $29.40
BUSINESS 83 (ROW) 1290 26 $0.01 $12.90 $335.40 $975.00 $25,350.00 $1.00 $1,290.00 $33,540.00 $0.90 $1,161.00 $30,186.00 $0.55 $709.50 $18,447.00 $0.36 $464.40 $12,074.40 $24,336.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.97 $2,541.30 $66,073.80 $0.60 $774.00 $20,124.00
WARE ROAD (ROW) 797 26 $0.01 $7.97 $207.22 $1,300.00 $33,800.00 $1.10 $876.70 $22,794.20 $0.90 $717.30 $18,649.80 $0.60 $478.20 $12,433.20 $0.42 $334.74 $8,703.24 $0.60 $478.20 $12,433.20 $1.97 $1,570.09 $40,822.34 $0.60 $478.20 $12,433.20
UMBRELLA BIRD AND 29TH 2 26 $8.00 $16.00 $416.00 $12.50 $25.00 $650.00 $8.00 $16.00 $416.00 $30.00 $60.00 $1,560.00 $3.00 $6.00 $156.00 $2.13 $4.26 $110.76 $0.60 $1.20 $31.20

GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #2) $3,028.48 $92,502.80 $68,920.80 $63,967.80 NO BID $46,527.00 $44,287.62 $33,057.44 $45,319.04 $28,501.20 $46,947.20 $118,092.00 $35,739.60 $35,558.40
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ALVAREZ CITY/SCHOOL PARK 456 26 $0.16 $72.96 $1,896.96 $729.60 $18,969.60 $0.90 $410.40 $10,670.40 $0.72 $328.32 $8,536.32 $0.90 $23.40 $10,670.40 $0.48 $218.88 $5,690.88 $5,673.72 $0.64 $291.84 $7,587.84 $7,589.84 $0.50 $228.00 $5,928.00 $2.15 $980.40 $25,490.40 $0.78 $355.68 $9,247.68
BONHAM CITY/SCHOOL PARK 383 26 $0.18 $68.94 $1,792.44 $689.40 $17,924.40 $1.00 $383.00 $9,958.00 $0.72 $275.76 $7,169.76 $1.10 $28.60 $10,953.80 $0.48 $183.84 $4,779.84 $0.64 $245.12 $6,373.12 $0.80 $306.40 $7,966.40 $2.15 $823.45 $21,409.70 $0.78 $298.74 $7,767.24
NAVARRO CITY/SCHOOL PARK 182 26 $0.03 $5.46 $141.96 $546.00 $14,196.00 $1.20 $218.40 $5,678.40 $0.72 $131.04 $3,407.04 $1.20 $31.20 $5,678.40 $0.48 $87.36 $2,271.36 $0.85 $154.70 $4,022.20 $1.00 $182.00 $4,732.00 $2.15 $391.30 $10,173.80 $0.78 $141.96 $3,690.96
ROOSEVELT CITY/SCHOOL 
PARK 266 26 $0.03 $7.98 $207.48 $798.00 $20,748.00 $1.20 $319.20 $8,299.20 $0.72 $191.52 $4,979.52 $1.10 $28.60 $7,607.60 $0.48 $127.68 $3,319.68 $0.64 $170.24 $4,426.24 $1.10 $292.60 $7,607.60 $2.15 $571.90 $14,869.40 $0.78 $207.48 $5,394.48
SEGUIN CITY/SCHOOL PARK 442 26 $0.18 $79.56 $2,068.56 $795.60 $20,685.60 $0.90 $397.80 $10,342.80 $0.72 $318.24 $8,274.24 $0.90 $23.40 $10,342.80 $0.48 $212.16 $5,516.16 $0.64 $282.88 $7,354.88 $0.50 $221.00 $5,746.00 $2.15 $950.30 $24,707.80 $0.78 $344.76 $8,963.76

No Bid

N
O
 
B
I
D

N
O
 
B
I
D

N
O
 
B
I
D

26 $79.56 $2,068.56 $795.60 $20,685.60 $397.80 $10,342.80 $318.24 $8,274.24 $23.40 $10,342.80 $212.16 $5,516.16 $282.88 $7,354.88 $221.00 $5,746.00 $950.30 $24,707.80 $344.76 $8,963.76
VICTOR FIELDS/SCHOOL PARK 263 26 $0.03 $7.89 $205.14 $789.00 $20,514.00 $1.20 $315.60 $8,205.60 $0.72 $189.36 $4,923.36 $1.10 $28.60 $7,521.80 $0.48 $126.24 $3,282.24 $0.64 $168.32 $4,376.32 $0.60 $157.80 $4,102.80 $2.15 $565.45 $14,701.70 $0.60 $157.80 $4,102.80
DOC NEUHAUS PARK 102 26 $0.06 $6.12 $159.12 $612.00 $15,912.00 $1.50 $153.00 $3,978.00 $0.72 $73.44 $1,909.44 $1.40 $36.40 $3,712.80 $0.48 $48.96 $1,272.96 $0.85 $86.70 $2,254.20 $1.15 $117.30 $3,049.80 $2.20 $224.40 $5,834.40 $0.78 $79.56 $2,068.56
TRAVIS TENNIS COURT 7 26 $0.01 $0.07 $1.82 $70.00 $1,820.00 $7.00 $49.00 $1,274.00 $4.50 $31.50 $819.00 $3.00 $78.00 $546.00 $1.00 $7.00 $182.00 $12.00 $84.00 $2,184.00 $1.00 $7.00 $182.00 $2.00 $14.00 $364.00 $2.00 $14.00 $364.00
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #3) $6,471.66 $130,769.60 $58,406.40 $40,018.68 $57,033.60 $26,315.12 $26,297.96 $38,578.80 $39,314.60 $117,551.20 $41,599.48
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R TOTAL 

COST
ANZALDUAS INTERNATIONAL 
BRIDGE 335 52 $0.36 $120.60 $6,271.20 $1,206.00 $62,712.00 $1.50 $502.50 $26,130.00 $1.84 $616.40 $32,052.80 $1.20 $402.00 $20,904.00 $0.60 $201.00 $10,452.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.30 $435.50 $22,646.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.62 $207.70 $10,800.40
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #5) $6,271.20 $62,712.00 $26,130.00 $32,052.80 $20,904.00 $10,452.00 No Bid $22,646.00 $0.00 $10,800.40

CONTRACT #6 MOWING AND 
TRIMMING SERVICES                               

EST. SQ. 
FT. P/1000

NO.      
CYCLES

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST
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PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
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CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 
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FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
UNIT PRICE 

PER 1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 

1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
EXPS 83 TAYLOR RD TO 
JACKSON RD 2600 52 $0.90 $2,340.00 $121,680.00 $2,340.00 $121,680.00 $1.00 $2,600.00 $135,200.00 $0.89 $2,314.00 $120,328.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.55 $1,430.00 $74,360.00 $709.50 $36,894.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.95 $5,070.00 $263,640.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.75 $1,950.00 $101,400.00

GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #6) $121,680.00 $121,680.00 $135,200.00 $120,328.00 NO BID $74,360.00 $36,894.00 No Bid $263,640.00 $0.00 $101,400.00

CONTRACT #7 MOWING AND 
TRIMMING SERVICES                               

EST. SQ. 
FT. P/1000

NO.      
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FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
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R TOTAL
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R TOTAL 
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TOTAL
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R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTE
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R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 
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TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 
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FT
CORRECTE
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CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 
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CORRECTE
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CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 
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CORRECTE
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CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 
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TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 

1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
BALBOA PARK 35 26 $0.29 $10.15 $263.90 $101.50 $2,639.00 $2.00 $70.00 $1,820.00 $2.50 $87.50 $2,275.00 $2.00 $70.00 $1,820.00 $1.25 $43.75 $1,137.50 $1,137.25 $1.00 $35.00 $910.00 $3.18 $111.30 $2,893.80 $0.60 $21.00 $546.00
CURTIS PARK 158 26 $0.05 $7.90 $205.40 $790.00 $20,540.00 $1.50 $237.00 $6,162.00 $0.80 $126.40 $3,286.40 $1.75 $276.50 $7,189.00 $0.63 $99.54 $2,588.04 $1.00 $158.00 $4,108.00 $3.18 $502.44 $13,063.44 $0.78 $123.24 $3,204.24
FRONTAGE PARK 58 26 $0.02 $1.16 $30.16 $116.00 $3,016.00 $2.00 $116.00 $3,016.00 $1.30 $75.40 $1,960.40 $2.00 $116.00 $3,016.00 $1.25 $72.50 $1,885.00 $1.00 $58.00 $1,508.00 $3.63 $210.54 $5,474.04 $0.78 $45.24 $1,176.24
 HACKBERRY PARK 109 26 $0.02 $2.18 $56.68 $218.00 $5,668.00 $1.50 $163.50 $4,251.00 $0.95 $103.55 $2,692.30 $1.75 $190.75 $4,959.50 $1.25 $136.25 $3,542.50 $1.00 $109.00 $2,834.00 $2.12 $231.08 $6,008.08 $0.78 $85.02 $2,210.52
LINBERG ALLEY 10 26 $0.05 $0.50 $13.00 $50.00 $600.00 $3.00 $30.00 $780.00 $360.00 $4.50 $45.00 $1,170.00 $540.00 $2.00 $20.00 $520.00 $240.00 $2.50 $25.00 $650.00 $300.00 $1.00 $10.00 $260.00 $120.00 $1.97 $19.70 $512.20 $236.40 $0.78 $7.80 $202.80 $93.60
MUNICIPAL PARK 1065 26 $0.17 $181.05 $4,707.30 $1,810.50 $47,073.00 $0.75 $798.75 $20,767.50 $0.72 $766.80 $19,936.80 $0.65 $692.25 $17,998.50 $4.38 $4,664.70 $121,282.20 $12,128.20 $1.00 $1,065.00 $27,690.00 $2.66 $2,832.90 $73,655.40 $0.78 $830.70 $21,598.20
POLICE OFFICERS TRAINING 
FACILITY 54 26 $0.08 $4.32 $112.32 $432.00 $11,232.00 $2.25 $121.50 $3,159.00 $1.30 $70.20 $1,825.20 $2.00 $108.00 $2,808.00 $1.69 $91.26 $2,372.76 $1.00 $54.00 $1,404.00 $2.12 $114.48 $2,976.48 $0.62 $33.48 $870.48
RETAMA VILLAGE PARK 157 26 $0.02 $3.14 $81.64 $314.00 $8,164.00 $1.50 $235.50 $6,123.00 $0.80 $125.60 $3,265.60 $1.75 $274.75 $7,143.50 $0.75 $117.75 $3,061.50 $1.00 $157.00 $4,082.00 $2.12 $332.84 $8,653.84 $0.78 $122.46 $3,183.96

ROMALI PARK (UNDEVELOPED) 16 26 No Bid NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $3.00 $48.00 $1,248.00 $3.50 $56.00 $1,456.00 $2.50 $40.00 $1,040.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.00 $16.00 $416.00 $1.97 $31.52 $819.52 $0.78 $12.48 $324.48
SUNDANCE MOBILE HOME 

N
O
 
B
I
D

N
O
 
B
I
D

N
O
 
B
I
D

CONTRACTOR TOTALS

PARK 556 26 $0.04 $22.24 $578.24 $2,224.00 $57,824.00 $1.50 $834.00 $21,684.00 $0.72 $400.32 $10,408.32 $1.50 $834.00 $21,684.00 $0.38 $211.28 $5,493.28 $1.00 $556.00 $14,456.00 $3.63 $2,018.28 $52,475.28 $0.78 $433.68 $11,275.68
WESTSIDE PARK 1065 26 $0.17 $181.05 $4,707.30 $1,810.50 $47,073.00 $0.75 $798.75 $20,767.50 $0.72 $766.80 $19,936.80 $0.65 $692.25 $17,998.50 $0.38 $404.70 $10,522.20 $1.00 $1,065.00 $27,690.00 $3.26 $3,471.90 $90,269.40 $0.78 $830.70 $21,598.20
WESTERN PARK 11 26 $0.07 $0.77 $20.02 $77.00 $2,002.00 $3.00 $33.00 $858.00 $3.50 $38.50 $1,001.00 $2.50 $27.50 $715.00 $5.60 $61.60 $1,601.60 $1.00 $11.00 $286.00 $3.18 $34.98 $909.48 $0.78 $8.58 $223.08

GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #7) $10,775.96 $205,831.00 $90,636.00 $90,216.00 $69,213.82 $68,583.82 NO BID $86,892.00 $86,612.00 $154,136.58 $44,632.60 $85,644.00 $85,504.00 $257,710.96 $257,435.15 $66,413.88 $66,304.68

Z:\EXCEL\Bid Tabs\BT SERVICE\BTS42-76 GROUND MAINTENANCE



BIDDERS:

BID OPENING: July 22, 2010 at 2:00 p.m.
LOCATION:  Conference Room

RODRIGUEZ LAWN CARE
McALLEN, TX

PROJECT NO.:  07-10-S42-76 SERVICE CONTRACT FOR GROUND MAINTENANCE 2010

VALLEY GARDEN CENTER                                 
MCALLEN, TX

AG III CONTRACTORS
SAN BENITO, TX

OASIS IRRIGATION AND LANDSCAPE
MCALLEN, TX 

TLC TOTAL LAWN CARE
MCALLEN, TX

LOPEZ NURSERY
MCALLEN, TX

LAWN CARE EXPERTS
EDINBURG, TX

INNOVATIVE ENVIRONMENTS 
MCALLEN, TX

MALDONADO NURSERY & LANDSCAPING                    
LA FERIA, TX

CONTRACT #1 LANDSCAPE BED 
MAINTENANCE SERVICES    

NO.      
CYCLES

UNIT PRICE 
PER CYCLE

UNIT PRICE  
PER CYCLE

UNIT PRICE 
PER CYCLE

UNIT PRICE    
PER CYCLE

UNIT PRICE 
PER CYCLE

UNIT PRICE 
PER CYCLE

UNIT PRICE 
PER CYCLE

UNIT PRICE  
PER CYCLE

UNIT PRICE    
PER CYCLE

ALONG 2ND STREET TRAIL 26 $11,700.00 $600.00 $2,232.44 $500.00 $1,200.00 $10,625.00 $350.00 No Bid $774.00
AONG BICENTENNIAL TRAIL 26 $4,600.00 $600.00 $1,328.39 $500.00 $550.00 $10,525.00 $275.00 No Bid $460.00
CONTRACT #3 LANDSCAPE BED 
MAINTENANCE SERVICES
VICTOR FIELDS SCHOOL PARK 26 $6,500.00 $200.00 $122.95 $150.00 $80.00 $3,900.00 $75.00 No Bid $50.00
CONTRACT #4 LANDSCAPE BED 
MAINTENANCE SERVICES
HWY 107 WARE RD TO 
EDINBURG CITY LIM. 26 $25,350.00 $500.00 $800.00 NO BID $400.00 $5,300.00 $40.00 No Bid $1,000.00
WARE ROAD (BUS. 83 TO 3 MILE 
LINE) 26 $16,900.00 $750.00 $725.00 NO BID $400.00 $9,500.00 $50.00 No Bid $600.00
MCCOLL ROAD 26 $3,120.00 $100.00 $650.00 NO BID $400.00 $3,900.00 $50.00 No Bid $60.00
CONTRACT #5 LANDSCAPE BED 
MAINTENANCE SERVICES
ANZALDUAS INTERNATIONAL 
BRIDGE 26 $4,550.00 $200.00 $351.50 $300.00 $125.00 No Bid $500.00 No Bid $58.00
CONTRACT #6 LANDSCAPE BED 
MAINTENANCE SERVICES
EXPRESSWAY 83 TAYLOR RD. 
TO JACKSON 26 $11 700 00 $2 200 00 $2 153 90 NO BID $500 00 No Bid $500 00 No Bid $2 410 00TO JACKSON 26 $11,700.00 $2,200.00 $2,153.90 NO BID $500.00 No Bid $500.00 No Bid $2,410.00
CONTRACT #7 LANDSCAPE BED 
MAINTENANCE SERVICES
BALBOA PARK 26 $1,300.00 $100.00 $65.00 NO BID $500.00 $1,690.00 $500.00 No Bid $25.00
POLICE OFFICERS TRAINING 
FACILITY 26 $1,950.00 $100.00 $149.99 NO BID $500.00 $4,290.00 $500.00 No Bid $150.00

CONTRACT #1 LITTER AND DEBRIS 
REMOVAL

EST. SQ. 
FT. P/1000

NO.      
CYCLES

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
UNIT PRICE 

PER 1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 

1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

2ND STREET TRAIL EXCLUDING 
THE SUBDIVISION FRONTS 4556 26 $0.23 $1,047.88 $27,244.88 $420.00 $10,920.00 $0.15 $683.40 $17,768.40 $0.33 $1,503.48 $39,090.48 $1,366.80 $35,536.80 $0.20 $911.20 $23,691.20 $0.10 $455.60 $11,845.60 $0.20 $911.20 $23,691.20 $0.10 $455.60 $11,845.60 $0.26 $1,184.56 $30,798.56 $0.06 $273.36 $7,107.36
BICENTENNIAL 2711 26 $0.35 $948.85 $24,670.10 $3,730.00 $9,699.80 $0.15 $406.65 $10,572.90 $0.33 $894.63 $23,260.38 $813.20 $21,145.80 $0.20 $542.20 $14,097.20 $0.10 $271.10 $7,048.60 $0.20 $542.20 $14,097.20 $0.15 $406.65 $10,572.90 $392.40 $10,202.40 $0.26 $704.86 $18,326.36 $0.06 $162.66 $4,229.16
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #1) $51,914.98 $20,619.80 $28,341.30 $62,350.86 $56,682.60 $37,788.40 $18,894.20 $37,788.40 $22,418.50 $22,048.00 $49,124.92 $11,336.52

CONTRACT #2 LITTER AND DEBRIS 
REMOVAL                                                  

EST. SQ. 
FT. P/1000

NO.      
CYCLES

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
UNIT PRICE 

PER 1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTE

D TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 

1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
FERN BLVD 12 26 $0.15 $1.80 $46.80 $0.40 $4.80 $124.80 $2.08 $24.96 $648.96 $0.25 $3.00 $78.00 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20 $187.00 $1.00 $12.00 $312.00 $0.20 $2.40 $62.40 $0.06 $0.72 $18.72
GALVESTON 12 26 $0.15 $1.80 $46.80 $0.40 $4.80 $124.80 $2.08 $24.96 $648.96 $0.25 $3.00 $78.00 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20 $187.00 $1.00 $12.00 $312.00 $0.20 $2.40 $62.40 $0.06 $0.72 $18.72
LUCILLE 12 26 $0.15 $1.80 $46.80 $0.40 $4.80 $124.80 $2.08 $24.96 $648.96 $0.25 $3.00 $78.00 $0.60 $7.20 $187.20 $187.00 $1.00 $12.00 $312.00 $0.20 $2.40 $62.40 $0.06 $0.72 $18.72
ROSE ELLEN 18 26 $0.15 $2.70 $70.20 $0.40 $7.20 $187.20 $2.08 $37.44 $973.44 $0.25 $4.50 $117.00 $81.00 $2.50 $45.00 $1,170.00 $1.00 $18.00 $468.00 $0.20 $3.60 $93.60 $0.06 $1.08 $28.08
WESTWAY 30 26 $0.15 $4.50 $117.00 $0.40 $12.00 $312.00 $2.08 $62.40 $1,622.40 $0.25 $7.50 $195.00 $2.50 $75.00 $1,950.00 $1.00 $30.00 $780.00 $0.20 $6.00 $156.00 $0.06 $1.80 $46.80
7TH STREET 24 26 $0.15 $3.60 $93.60 $0.40 $9.60 $249.60 $2.08 $49.92 $1,297.92 $0.25 $6.00 $156.00 $2.50 $60.00 $1,560.00 $1.00 $24.00 $624.00 $0.20 $4.80 $124.80 $0.06 $1.44 $37.44
8TH STREET 12 26 $0.15 $1.80 $46.80 $0.40 $4.80 $124.80 $2.08 $24.96 $648.96 $0.25 $3.00 $78.00 $2.50 $30.00 $780.00 $1.50 $18.00 $468.00 $0.20 $2.40 $62.40 $0.06 $0.72 $18.72
15TH STREET 36 26 $0.15 $5.40 $140.40 $0.40 $14.40 $374.40 $2.08 $74.88 $1,946.88 $0.25 $9.00 $234.00 $2.00 $72.00 $1,872.00 $1.00 $36.00 $936.00 $0.20 $7.20 $187.20 $0.06 $2.16 $56.16 $56.12
MARTIN BLVD. 20 26 $0.15 $3.00 $78.00 $0.40 $8.00 $208.00 $2.08 $41.60 $1,081.60 $0.25 $5.00 $130.00 $2.50 $50.00 $1,300.00 $1.00 $20.00 $520.00 $0.20 $4.00 $104.00 $0.06 $1.20 $31.20
CAMELIA CIRCLE 9 26 $0.15 $1.35 $35.10 $0.40 $3.60 $93.60 $2.25 $20.25 $526.50 $0.25 $2.25 $58.50 $3.00 $27.00 $702.00 $1.00 $9.00 $234.00 $0.20 $1.80 $46.80 $0.06 $0.54 $14.04
GARDENIA CIRCLE 10 26 $0.15 $1.50 $39.00 $0.40 $4.00 $104.00 $2.25 $22.50 $585.00 $0.25 $2.50 $65.00 $3.00 $30.00 $780.00 $1.00 $10.00 $260.00 $0.20 $2.00 $52.00 $0.06 $0.60 $15.60
QUINCE CIRCLE 7 26 $0.15 $1.05 $27.30 $0.40 $2.80 $72.80 $2.08 $14.56 $378.56 $0.25 $1.75 $45.50 $3.50 $24.50 $637.00 $1.00 $7.00 $182.00 $84.00 $0.20 $1.40 $36.40 $0.06 $0.42 $10.92
BUSINESS 83 (ROW) 1290 26 $0.15 $193.50 $5,031.00 $0.35 $451.50 $11,739.00 $0.50 $645.00 $16,770.00 $0.10 $129.00 $3,354.00 $6,760.00 $0.65 $838.50 $21,801.00 $43,940.00 $0.15 $193.50 $5,031.00 $0.36 $464.40 $12,074.40 $0.06 $77.40 $2,012.40
WARE ROAD (ROW) 797 26 $0.15 $119.55 $3,108.30 $0.40 $318.80 $8,288.80 $0.45 $358.65 $9,324.90 $0.10 $79.70 $2,072.20 $0.87 $693.39 $18,028.14 $0.16 $127.52 $3,315.52 $0.36 $286.92 $7,459.92 $0.06 $47.82 $1,243.32 $1,243.22
UMBRELLA BIRD AND 29TH 2 26 $0.50 $1.00 $26.00 $12.00 $24.00 $624.00 $0.25 $0.50 $13.00 $30.00 $60.00 $1,560.00 $1.00 $2.00 $52.00 $0.20 $0.40 $10.40 $0.06 $0.12 $3.12
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #2) $8,927.10 $22,154.60 $37,727.04 NO BID $6,752.20 $10,122.00 $52,701.74 $74,840.00 $13,806.52 $13,708.52 $20,595.12 $3,573.96 $3,573.82

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE CONTRACTO UNIT PRICE CONTRACTO CONTRACTO UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE CONTRACTO UNIT PRICE CONTRACTO
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CONTRACT #3 LITTER AND DEBRIS 
REMOVAL

EST. SQ. 
FT. P/1000

NO.      
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UNIT PRICE 
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FT TOTAL TOTAL COST
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PER 1000SQ 
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CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
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PER 

1000SQ FT
CORRECTED 

TOTAL
CORRECTED 
TOTAL COST

CONTRACTOR 
TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
ALVAREZ CITY/SCHOOL PARK 456 26 $0.35 $159.60 $4,149.60 $0.20 $91.20 $2,371.20 $0.24 $109.44 $2,845.44 $0.20 $91.20 $2,371.20 $0.20 $91.20 $2,371.20 $0.45 $205.20 $5,335.20 $0.15 $68.40 $1,778.40 $0.25 $114.00 $2,964.00 $0.06 $27.36 $711.36
BONHAM CITY/SCHOOL PARK 383 26 $0.35 $134.05 $3,485.30 $0.20 $76.60 $1,991.60 $0.24 $91.92 $2,389.92 $0.20 $76.60 $1,991.60 $0.20 $76.60 $1,991.60 $0.45 $172.35 $4,481.10 $0.15 $57.45 $1,493.70 $0.25 $95.75 $2,489.50 $0.06 $22.98 $597.48
NAVARRO CITY/SCHOOL PARK 182 26 $0.35 $63.70 $1,656.20 $0.20 $36.40 $946.40 $0.24 $43.68 $1,135.68 $0.20 $36.40 $946.40 $0.20 $36.40 $946.40 $0.45 $81.90 $2,129.40 $0.15 $27.30 $709.80 $0.25 $45.50 $1,183.00 $0.06 $10.92 $283.92
ROOSEVELT CITY/SCHOOL 
PARK 266 26 $0.35 $93.10 $2,420.60 $0.20 $53.20 $1,383.20 $0.24 $63.84 $1,659.84 $0.20 $53.20 $1,383.20 $0.20 $53.20 $1,383.20 $0.45 $119.70 $3,112.20 $0.25 $66.50 $1,729.00 $0.25 $66.50 $1,729.00 $0.06 $15.96 $414.96
SEGUIN CITY/SCHOOL PARK 442 26 $0.35 $154.70 $4,022.20 $0.20 $88.40 $2,298.40 $0.24 $106.08 $2,758.08 $0.20 $88.40 $2,298.40 $0.20 $88.40 $2,298.40 $0.45 $198.90 $5,171.40 $0.15 $66.30 $1,723.80 $0.25 $110.50 $2,873.00 $0.06 $26.52 $689.52
VICTOR FIELDS/SCHOOL PARK 263 26 $0.35 $92.05 $2,393.30 $0.20 $52.60 $1,367.60 $0.24 $63.12 $1,641.12 $0.20 $52.60 $1,367.60 $0.20 $52.60 $1,367.60 $0.45 $118.35 $3,077.10 $0.20 $52.60 $1,367.60 $0.25 $65.75 $1,709.50 $0.06 $15.78 $410.28
DOC NEUHAUS PARK 102 26 $0.35 $35.70 $928.20 $0.20 $20.40 $530.40 $0.24 $24.48 $636.48 $0.20 $20.40 $530.40 $0.20 $20.40 $530.40 $0.45 $45.90 $1,193.40 $0.25 $25.50 $663.00 $0.25 $25.50 $663.00 $0.12 $12.24 $318.24
TRAVIS TENNIS COURT 7 26 $0.35 $24.50 $637.00 $0.50 $3.50 $91.00 $1.24 $8.68 $225.68 $0.20 $1.40 $36.40 $0.25 $1.75 $45.50 $12.86 $90.02 $2,340.52 $0.25 $1.75 $45.50 $0.25 $1.75 $45.50 $1.00 $7.00 $182.00
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #3) $19,692.40 $10,979.80 $13,292.24 $10,925.20 $10,934.30 $26,840.32 $9,510.80 $13,656.50 $3,607.76

Z:\EXCEL\Bid Tabs\BT SERVICE\BTS42-76 GROUND MAINTENANCE



BIDDERS:

BID OPENING: July 22, 2010 at 2:00 p.m.
LOCATION:  Conference Room

RODRIGUEZ LAWN CARE
McALLEN, TX

PROJECT NO.:  07-10-S42-76 SERVICE CONTRACT FOR GROUND MAINTENANCE 2010

VALLEY GARDEN CENTER                                 
MCALLEN, TX

AG III CONTRACTORS
SAN BENITO, TX

OASIS IRRIGATION AND LANDSCAPE
MCALLEN, TX 

TLC TOTAL LAWN CARE
MCALLEN, TX

LOPEZ NURSERY
MCALLEN, TX

LAWN CARE EXPERTS
EDINBURG, TX

INNOVATIVE ENVIRONMENTS 
MCALLEN, TX

MALDONADO NURSERY & LANDSCAPING                    
LA FERIA, TX

CONTRACT #4 LITTER AND 
DEBRIS REMOVAL

NO. 
CYCLE

S

UNIT 
PRICE     
PER 

CYCLE

UNIT 
PRICE     
PER 

CYCLE

UNIT 
PRICE     
PER 

CYCLE
UNIT PRICE   
PER CYCLE

UNIT 
PRICE     
PER 

CYCLE

UNIT 
PRICE     
PER 

CYCLE

UNIT 
PRICE     
PER 

CYCLE

UNIT 
PRICE     
PER 

CYCLE

UNIT 
PRICE    
PER 

CYCLE
HWY 107 WARE RD TO 
EDINBURG CITY LIM. 26 $3,120.00 $30.00 $750.00 NO BID $100.00 $6,500.00 $130.00 No Bid $100.00
WARE ROAD (BUS. 83 TO 3 MILE 
LINE) 26 $1,300.00 $40.00 $675.00 NO BID $100.00 $6,500.00 $110.00 No Bid $50.00

MCCOLL ROAD 26 $650.00 $10.00 $600.00 NO BID $100.00 $4,290.00 $150.00 No Bid $12.50

CONTRACT #5 LITTER AND DEBRIS 
REMOVAL

EST. SQ. 
FT. P/1000

NO.      
CYCLES
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CORRECTED 
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CONTRACTOR 
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CORRECTED 
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R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 
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FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
PER 1000SQ 

FT TOTAL TOTAL COST
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FT TOTAL TOTAL COST

UNIT PRICE 
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FT
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R TOTAL 

COST
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CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
ANZALDUAS INTERNATIONAL 
BRIDGE 335 52 $0.35 $117.25 $6,097.00 $0.20 $67.00 $3,484.00 $0.54 $180.90 $9,406.80 $0.20 $67.00 $3,484.00 $0.10 $33.50 $1,742.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.20 $67.00 $3,484.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.06 $20.10 $1,045.20
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #5) $6,097.00 $3,484.00 $9,406.80 $3,484.00 $1,742.00 No Bid $3,484.00 $1,045.20

CONTRACT #6 LITTER AND 
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COST
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R TOTAL

CONTRACTO
R TOTAL 

COST
EXPS 83 TAYLOR RD TOEXPS 83 TAYLOR RD TO 
JACKSON RD 1290 52 $0.35 $451.50 $23,478.00 $0.30 $387.00 $20,124.00 $0.45 $580.50 $30,186.00 $1,170.00 $60,840.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.10 $129.00 $6,708.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.17 $1,509.30 $78,483.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.06 $77.40 $4,024.80
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #6) $23,478.00 $20,124.00 $30,186.00 $60,840.00 NO BID $6,708.00 NO BID $78,483.60

CONTRACT #7 LITTER AND DEBRIS 
REMOVAL

EST. SQ. 
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NO.      
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CONTRACTO
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BALBOA PARK 35 26 $0.12 $4.20 $109.20 $42.00 $1,092.00 $0.30 $10.50 $273.00 $0.75 $26.25 $682.50 $0.20 $7.00 $182.00 $0.65 $22.75 $591.50 $0.50 $17.50 $455.00 $0.26 $9.10 $236.60 $0.06 $2.10 $54.60
CURTIS PARK 158 26 $0.83 $131.14 $3,409.64 $131.14 $3,409.64 $0.30 $47.40 $1,232.40 $0.33 $52.14 $1,355.64 $0.20 $31.60 $821.60 $0.65 $102.70 $2,670.20 $0.50 $79.00 $2,054.00 $0.26 $41.08 $1,068.08 $0.06 $9.48 $246.48
FRONTAGE PARK 58 26 $0.11 $6.38 $165.88 $63.80 $1,658.80 $0.30 $17.40 $452.40 $0.75 $43.50 $1,131.00 $0.20 $11.60 $301.60 $0.75 $43.50 $1,131.00 $0.50 $29.00 $754.00 $0.26 $15.08 $392.08 $0.06 $3.48 $90.48
 HACKBERRY PARK 109 26 $0.11 $11.99 $311.74 $119.90 $3,117.40 $0.30 $32.70 $850.20 $0.33 $35.97 $935.22 $0.20 $21.80 $566.80 $0.65 $70.85 $1,842.10 $0.50 $54.50 $1,417.00 $0.30 $32.70 $850.20 $0.06 $6.54 $170.04
LINBERG ALLEY 10 26 $0.03 $0.30 $7.80 $30.00 $780.00 $0.30 $3.00 $78.00 $1.00 $10.00 $260.00 $0.20 $2.00 $52.00 $0.85 $8.50 $221.00 $0.50 $5.00 $130.00 $0.26 $2.60 $67.60 $0.06 $0.60 $15.60
MUNICIPAL PARK 1065 26 $1.88 $2,002.20 $52,057.20 $200.22 $5,205.72 $0.20 $213.00 $5,538.00 $0.45 $479.25 $12,460.50 $0.10 $106.50 $2,769.00 $0.65 $692.25 $17,998.50 $0.50 $532.50 $13,845.00 $0.34 $362.10 $9,414.60 $0.06 $63.90 $1,661.40
POLICE OFFICERS TRAINING 
FACILITY 54 26 $0.10 $5.40 $140.40 $54.00 $1,404.00 $0.30 $16.20 $421.20 $0.75 $40.50 $1,053.00 $0.20 $10.80 $280.80 $0.85 $45.90 $1,193.40 $0.50 $27.00 $702.00 $0.30 $16.20 $421.20 $0.06 $3.24 $84.24
RETAMA VILLAGE PARK 157 26 $0.80 $125.60 $3,265.60 $125.60 $3,265.60 $0.30 $47.10 $1,224.60 $0.33 $51.81 $1,347.06 $0.20 $31.40 $816.40 $1.15 $180.55 $4,694.30 $0.50 $78.50 $2,041.00 $0.30 $47.10 $1,224.60 $0.06 $9.42 $244.92

ROMALI PARK (UNDEVELOPED) 16 26 $0.30 $4.80 $124.80 $1.00 $16.00 $416.00 $0.20 $3.20 $83.20 $1.85 $29.60 $769.60 $0.50 $8.00 $208.00 $0.24 $3.84 $99.84 $0.06 $0.96 $24.96
SUNDANCE MOBILE HOME 
PARK 556 26 $0.32 $177.92 $177.92 $177.92 $4,625.92 $0.20 $111.20 $2,891.20 $0.45 $250.20 $6,505.20 $0.20 $111.20 $2,891.20 $0.85 $472.60 $12,287.60 $0.50 $278.00 $7,228.00 $0.26 $144.56 $3,758.56 $0.06 $33.36 $867.36
WESTSIDE PARK 1065 26 $1.88 $2,002.20 $48.88 $200.22 $5,205.72 $0.20 $213.00 $5,538.00 $0.45 $479.25 $12,460.50 $0.10 $106.50 $2,769.00 $0.85 $905.25 $23,536.50 $0.50 $532.50 $13,845.00 $0.43 $457.95 $11,906.70 $0.06 $63.90 $1,661.40
WESTERN PARK 11 26 $0.03 $0.33 $8.58 $33.00 $858.00 $0.30 $3.30 $85.80 $1.00 $11.00 $286.00 $0.20 $2.20 $57.20 $1.85 $20.35 $529.10 $0.50 $5.50 $143.00 $0.26 $2.86 $74.36 $0.06 $0.66 $17.16
GRAND TOTAL ALL LOCATIONS 
(CONTRACT #7) $59,702.84 $858.00 $18,709.60 $38,892.62 NO BID $11,590.80 $67,464.80 $42,822.00 $29,514.42 $5,138.64 $8,746.40
**ADDITIONAL SERVICE** 
CONTRACT #6  (SEE 
SPECIFICATION ON PAGE 14) 
ONE TIME INITIAL LANDSCAPE 
BED CLEANUP OF 
EXPRESSWAY 83, JACKSON TO 
TAYLOR TOTAL COST: $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $12,000.00 $2,937.45 NO BID $1,200.00 No Bid $1,500.00 No Bid $14,000.00

NO BID

Contract #1 for Mowing & Trimming Services: total & total costs per 
cycle are wrong; Contract #2 for Mowing & Trimming services: total 

& total costs per cycle are wrong; Contract #3 for Mowing & 
Trimming Services: total & total costs per cycle are wrong; contract 

No Bid

N
O
 
B
I
D

N
O
 
B
I
D

N
O
 
B
I
D

Contract #1 for Mowing & Trimming Services, total cost discrepancyContract #1 for Litter & Removal;  total amount is incorrect; 
Contract # 6 for Litter & Debris Removal - Contractor quoted on 

2600 sq ft.

Contract #2 for Mowing & Trimming, grand total discrepancy; 
Contract # 3, item #1 (Alvarez City School Park) total discrepancy

Contract #1, item #2 for Mowing & Trimming Services total is incorrect; 
Contract #2, for business 83 (ROW), total & total cost are incorrect; Total 
cost for Municipal Park item is incorrect; Contract #2 for Litter & Debris 
Removal, total is incorrect

Contract #1,  Bicentennial Trail Location for Mowing & Trimming total & 
total cost discrepancy; Contract #2 for Mowing & Trimming, grand total 
discrepancy; Contract #1 for Litter and Debris Removal, Bicentennial 
Trail total discrepancy; Contract #2 for Litter & Debris Removal, Quince 
Circle total discrepancy

Contract #1 for Mowing and Trimming Services, discrepancy on 
grand total; Contract #7 for Mowing & Trimming, discrepancy on 
grand total.

Contract #2 for Mowing & Trimming, discrepancy on grand total; 
Contract #7 for Litter & Debris Removal, discrepancy on grand total.

# 5 for mowing & trimming services, totals are wrong.; Contract #7 
for Litter & Debri Removal total is incorrect;

Circle, total discrepancy
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