
 6/13/11 kz

PROJECT NO.: 07-11-IPQ32 FURNITURE, FIXTURES, & EQUIPMENT FOR FIREMEN'S PARK 07/25/11…MQ

ITEM 
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL 

1 Stack Chair (Multi-Use Building) 60 EA *$242.95 $3,644.25 $73.00 $4,380.00 $195.00 $11,700.00 **$63.75 $3,825.00 ***$67.48 $4,048.80 $74.04 $4,442.20
Warranty
Delivery
Alternate Product                   (HON HG51)

revised 8/12/11…CSAWARDED VENDORS

DEADLINE:  July 22, 2011 at 4:00 p.m.

BIDDERS:

GATEWAY PRINTING JONES 
& COOK

THE EXCEPTIONAL HOME 
CENTER STANDARD SUPPLY J R INC.

BUFFALO BUSINESS 
PRODUCTS VALLEY DESIGNS, INC

EDINBURG, TX MCALLEN, TX HIDALGO, TX UNIVERSAL CITY, TX HARLINGEN, TX HARLINGEN, TX
TXMAS 6-7111060-32         
/ GSA GS-27F-OU51W DEALER/LOCAL PRICING DEALER/LOCAL PRICING DEALER/LOCAL PRICING DEALER/LOCAL PRICING TXMAS 3-7110400

NOT SPECIFIED LIMITED LIFETIME LIFETIME SEE ATTACHMENT NOT SPECIFIED 10 YEARS
4-6 WEEKS 4 WEEKS 7 DAYS 30-45 DAYS 30 DAYS 4-WEEKS

AS SPECIFIED TRENDWAY JET STACK HERCULES AS SPECIFIED AS SPECIFIED KRUEGER INTERNATIONAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

2
Rectangular Tables - (Multi-Use 
Building) 10 EA $533.00 $5,330.00 $460.00 $4,600.00 $495.00 $4,950.00
Warranty
Delivery
Alternate Product (SOUTHERN ALUMINUM)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDNOT SPECIFIED LIMITED LIFETIME LIFETIME
4-6 WEEKS 4-5 WEEKS TWO WEEKS

SURFACE WORKS AS SPECIFIED A308Alternate Product (SOUTHERN ALUMINUM) SURFACE WORKS AS SPECIFIED A308

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

3 Round Tables - (Multi-Use Building) 10 EA $890.56 $8,905.60 $536.00 $5,360.00 $585.00 $5,850.00
Warranty
Delivery
Alternate Product (SOUTHERN ALUMINUM)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDNOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED LIFETIME
4-6 WEEKS NOT SPECIFIED

***PRICING GOOD THROUGH 
09/30/11

TWO WEEKS
SURFACE WORKS AS SPECIFIED A-60RHL

*UNIT COST/CARTON OF 4
**SOLD IN 4 CHAIRS/CARTON 

ONLY
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