
(000363) BURTON AUTO SUP
<Quote: 00005110>0

(008814) MIDWAY AUTO SUP
<Quote: 00005111>0

(000294) BILL BUNTO
<Quote: 00005112>0

(000807) FRENCH-ELL
<Quote: 00005113>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001681

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

BULB, AUTOMOTIVE LIG
[BO]<01.0> 055-56-01001-4

120.0EA

$0.41

$49.20

*

$0.55

$66.00

$0.79

$94.80

$0.57

$68.40

Fluid, Brake  12oz.-
[BO]<02.0> 060-18-01001-4

100.0CAN

$1.45

$145.00

$1.48

$148.00

$1.99

$199.00

$6.07

$607.00

SHOES, BRAKE SHOES, 
[BO]<03.0> 060-21-01032-4

28.0SET

$61.00

$1,708.00

$62.90

$1,761.20

$99.49

$2,785.72

$84.68

$2,371.04

Brake, Disc Pad Rear
[BO]<04.0> 060-21-01033-2

50.0EA

$36.00

$1,800.00

$31.97

$1,598.50

$49.99

$2,499.50

$40.06

$2,003.00

ROTOR, BRAKE "REAR" 
[BO]<05.0> 060-21-02001-8

100.0EA

$36.00

$3,600.00

$34.90

$3,490.00

$44.95

$4,495.00

NB

No Bid

DRUM, BRAKE 8.75", R
[BO]<06.0> 060-21-03002-5

70.0EA

$67.95

$4,756.50

$90.50

$6,335.00

$79.95

$5,596.50

$69.00

$4,830.00

Filter, Air (AC, FL.
[BO]<07.0> 060-42-01016-2

100.0EA

$4.27

$427.00

$4.10

$410.00

$4.10

$410.00

$8.34

$834.00

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<08.0> 060-42-03021-0

48.0EA

$2.18

$104.64

$2.78

$133.44

$2.77

$132.96

$4.81

$230.88

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<09.0> 060-42-03022-8

144.0EA

$2.72

$391.68

$2.84

$408.96

$2.83

$407.52

$6.60

$950.40

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<10.0> 060-42-03025-1

30.0EA

$3.94

$118.20

$5.25

$157.50

$5.25

$157.50

$8.60

$258.00

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<11.0> 060-42-03036-8

450.0EA

$2.48

$1,116.00

$2.95

$1,327.50

$2.94

$1,323.00

$5.37

$2,416.50



(000363) BURTON AUTO SUP
<Quote: 00005110>0

(008814) MIDWAY AUTO SUP
<Quote: 00005111>0

(000294) BILL BUNTO
<Quote: 00005112>0

(000807) FRENCH-ELL
<Quote: 00005113>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001681

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

STRAP, 15" HEAVY DUT
[BO]<12.0> 280-75-01001-8

1200.0EA

$2.75

$3,300.00

$0.10

$120.00

*

$12.97

$15,564.00

$18.02

$21,624.00

LIGHT, SEAL BEAM (AC
[BO]<13.0> 285-46-01008-4

80.0EA

$6.35

$508.00

$2.65

$212.00

$5.25

$420.00

$4.74

$379.20

LUBRICANT, SPRAY, 11
[BO]<14.0> 405-24-01004-4

500.0CAN

$4.49

$2,245.00

*

$4.50

$2,250.00

$4.88

$2,440.00

$7.18

$3,590.00

Tape, Electrical 3/4
[BO]<15.0> 832-26-01001-1

200.0RL

$0.75

$150.00

$0.69

$138.00

$0.82

$164.00

$1.33

$266.00

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$20,419.22

$0.00

$0.00

$18,556.10

$0.00

$0.00

$36,689.50

$0.00

$0.00

$40,428.42

$0.00

$0.00



(004880) RUSH TRUCK
<Quote: 00005114>0

(004828) LAREDO WHO
<Quote: 00005115>0

(012523) GONZALEZ AUTO P
<Quote: 00005116>0

(009866) RUSSELL  SMITH
<Quote: 00005117>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001681

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

BULB, AUTOMOTIVE LIG
[BO]<01.0> 055-56-01001-4

120.0EA

$0.84

$100.80

$0.59

$70.80

$1.25

$150.00

$0.49

$58.80

Fluid, Brake  12oz.-
[BO]<02.0> 060-18-01001-4

100.0CAN

$1.43

$143.00

$1.29

$129.00

*

$2.25

$225.00

NB

No Bid

SHOES, BRAKE SHOES, 
[BO]<03.0> 060-21-01032-4

28.0SET

$51.92

$1,453.76

$48.00

$1,344.00

* NB

No Bid $83.67

$2,342.76

Brake, Disc Pad Rear
[BO]<04.0> 060-21-01033-2

50.0EA

$31.23

$1,561.50

$27.95

$1,397.50

*

$39.00

$1,950.00

$37.90

$1,895.00

ROTOR, BRAKE "REAR" 
[BO]<05.0> 060-21-02001-8

100.0EA

$54.99

$5,499.00

$27.95

$2,795.00

*

$39.00

$3,900.00

$37.28

$3,728.00

DRUM, BRAKE 8.75", R
[BO]<06.0> 060-21-03002-5

70.0EA

$64.99

$4,549.30

*

$82.00

$5,740.00

NB

No Bid $80.72

$5,650.40

Filter, Air (AC, FL.
[BO]<07.0> 060-42-01016-2

100.0EA

$4.19

$419.00

$2.99

$299.00

*,Tie

$4.10

$410.00

$5.13

$513.00

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<08.0> 060-42-03021-0

48.0EA

$2.52

$120.96

$1.44

$69.12

*

$2.78

$133.44

$3.07

$147.36

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<09.0> 060-42-03022-8

144.0EA

$2.85

$410.40

$1.44

$207.36

*

$2.84

$408.96

$3.49

$502.56

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<10.0> 060-42-03025-1

30.0EA

$4.39

$131.70

NB

No Bid $5.25

$157.50

$5.37

$161.10

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<11.0> 060-42-03036-8

450.0EA

$2.81

$1,264.50

$2.17

$976.50

*

$2.95

$1,327.50

$3.44

$1,548.00



(004880) RUSH TRUCK
<Quote: 00005114>0

(004828) LAREDO WHO
<Quote: 00005115>0

(012523) GONZALEZ AUTO P
<Quote: 00005116>0

(009866) RUSSELL  SMITH
<Quote: 00005117>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001681

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

STRAP, 15" HEAVY DUT
[BO]<12.0> 280-75-01001-8

1200.0EA

$0.15

$180.00

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

LIGHT, SEAL BEAM (AC
[BO]<13.0> 285-46-01008-4

80.0EA

$2.41

$192.80

$2.09

$167.20

*

$3.45

$276.00

$4.53

$362.40

LUBRICANT, SPRAY, 11
[BO]<14.0> 405-24-01004-4

500.0CAN NB

No Bid $4.99

$2,495.00

$5.95

$2,975.00

NB

No Bid

Tape, Electrical 3/4
[BO]<15.0> 832-26-01001-1

200.0RL

$1.19

$238.00

$0.62

$124.00

*

$1.25

$250.00

NB

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$16,264.72

$0.00

$0.00

$15,814.48

$0.00

$0.00

$12,163.40

$0.00

$0.00

$16,909.38

$0.00

$0.00



(005408) VEHICLE MA
<Quote: 00005118>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001681

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

BULB, AUTOMOTIVE LIG
[BO]<01.0> 055-56-01001-4

120.0EA

$0.46

$55.20

Fluid, Brake  12oz.-
[BO]<02.0> 060-18-01001-4

100.0CAN NB

No Bid

SHOES, BRAKE SHOES, 
[BO]<03.0> 060-21-01032-4

28.0SET NB

No Bid

Brake, Disc Pad Rear
[BO]<04.0> 060-21-01033-2

50.0EA NB

No Bid

ROTOR, BRAKE "REAR" 
[BO]<05.0> 060-21-02001-8

100.0EA NB

No Bid

DRUM, BRAKE 8.75", R
[BO]<06.0> 060-21-03002-5

70.0EA NB

No Bid

Filter, Air (AC, FL.
[BO]<07.0> 060-42-01016-2

100.0EA

$2.99

$299.00

*,Tie

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<08.0> 060-42-03021-0

48.0EA

$2.22

$106.56

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<09.0> 060-42-03022-8

144.0EA

$2.59

$372.96

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<10.0> 060-42-03025-1

30.0EA

$3.51

$105.30

*

Filter, Oil (AC, FL.
[BO]<11.0> 060-42-03036-8

450.0EA

$2.40

$1,080.00



(005408) VEHICLE MA
<Quote: 00005118>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001681

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

STRAP, 15" HEAVY DUT
[BO]<12.0> 280-75-01001-8

1200.0EA NB

No Bid

LIGHT, SEAL BEAM (AC
[BO]<13.0> 285-46-01008-4

80.0EA

$3.55

$284.00

LUBRICANT, SPRAY, 11
[BO]<14.0> 405-24-01004-4

500.0CAN NB

No Bid

Tape, Electrical 3/4
[BO]<15.0> 832-26-01001-1

200.0RL NB

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$2,303.02

$0.00

$0.00


