
(000820) GALLS INC
<Quote: 00005105>0

(007456) KEL-LAC UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005106>0

(010835) SCREENPRINT PLU
<Quote: 00005107>0

(008798) RED THE UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005108>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001678

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

UNIFORM TROUSERS, H.
[BO]<01.0> 200-72-01001-8

5.0EA

$22.29

$111.45

*

$27.65

$138.25

$37.73

$188.65

$27.50

$137.50

UNIFORM TROUSERS, H.
[BO]<02.0> 200-72-01002-6

1075.0EA

$22.29

$23,961.75

*

$27.65

$29,723.75

$37.73

$40,559.75

$27.50

$29,562.50

UNIFORM TROUSERS, H.
[BO]<03.0> 200-72-01003-4

5.0EA

$24.64

$123.20

*

$30.29

$151.45

$39.73

$198.65

$27.50

$137.50

UNIFORM TROUSERS, H.
[BO]<04.0> 200-72-02001-7

5.0EA

$23.99

$119.95

*

$28.99

$144.95

$39.73

$198.65

$29.50

$147.50

UNIFORM TROUSERS, H.
[BO]<05.0> 200-72-02002-5

75.0EA

$23.99

$1,799.25

*

$28.99

$2,174.25

$39.73

$2,979.75

$29.50

$2,212.50

UNIFORM TROUSERS, H.
[BO]<06.0> 200-72-02003-3

5.0EA

$26.49

$132.45

*

$35.33

$176.65

$41.73

$208.65

$29.50

$147.50

MEN~'S SHORT SLEEEVE 
[BO]<07.0> 200-72-03001-6

165.0EA

$20.19

$3,331.35

*

$25.37

$4,186.05

$23.00

$3,795.00

$25.35

$4,182.75

MEN~'S SHORT SLEEEVE 
[BO]<08.0> 200-72-03002-4

45.0EA

$21.99

$989.55

*

$25.37

$1,141.65

$23.00

$1,035.00

$27.90

$1,255.50

MENS SHORT SLEEVE SH
[BO]<09.0> 200-72-03003-2

5.0EA

$21.99

$109.95

*

$30.45

$152.25

$25.00

$125.00

$30.50

$152.50

T-SHIRTS, CLASS "C",
[BO]<10.0> 200-72-04001-5

1240.0EA

$6.19

$7,675.60

$4.89

$6,063.60

$3.27

$4,054.80

*

No Bid

T-SHIRTS, CLASS "C",
[BO]<11.0> 200-72-04002-3

235.0EA

$7.49

$1,760.15

$6.09

$1,431.15

$4.90

$1,151.50

*

No Bid



(000820) GALLS INC
<Quote: 00005105>0

(007456) KEL-LAC UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005106>0

(010835) SCREENPRINT PLU
<Quote: 00005107>0

(008798) RED THE UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005108>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001678

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

T-SHIRTS, CLASS "C",
[BO]<12.0> 200-72-04003-1

20.0EA

$7.99

$159.80

$6.75

$135.00

$4.90

$98.00

*

No Bid

EXCERCISE SHORTS, SI
[BO]<13.0> 200-72-05001-4

550.0EA

$13.99

$7,694.50

$6.28

$3,454.00

*

$25.00

$13,750.00

No Bid

EXCERCISE SHORTS, SI
[BO]<14.0> 200-72-05002-2

300.0EA

$14.49

$4,347.00

$7.34

$2,202.00

*

$27.00

$8,100.00

No Bid

EXCERCISE SHORTS, SI
[BO]<15.0> 200-72-05003-0

10.0EA

$15.19

$151.90

$8.08

$80.80

*

$29.00

$290.00

No Bid

TWILL WEAVE SHORTS, 
[BO]<16.0> 200-72-06001-3

80.0EA

$36.99

$2,959.20

$23.32

$1,865.60

*

$49.00

$3,920.00

$48.65

$3,892.00

TWILL WEAVE SHORTS, 
[BO]<17.0> 200-72-06002-1

5.0EA

$36.99

$184.95

$23.32

$116.60

*

$52.00

$260.00

$48.65

$243.25

TWILL WEAVE SHORTS, 
[BO]<18.0> 200-72-06003-9

5.0EA

$39.99

$199.95

$23.32

$116.60

*

$53.00

$265.00

$48.65

$243.25

UNIFORM BELT, DUTY M
[BO]<19.0> 200-72-08001-1

5.0EA

$12.50

$62.50

$11.11

$55.55

*

$13.50

$67.50

$16.45

$82.25

UNIFORM BELT, DUTY M
[BO]<20.0> 200-72-08002-9

180.0EA

$12.50

$2,250.00

$11.11

$1,999.80

*

$14.50

$2,610.00

$16.45

$2,961.00

UNIFORM BELT, DUTY M
[BO]<21.0> 200-72-08003-7

5.0EA

$16.50

$82.50

$11.11

$55.55

*

$16.50

$82.50

$16.45

$82.25

BASEBALL CAP-RICHARD
[BO]<22.0> 200-72-10001-7

550.0EA

$13.49

$7,419.50

$8.95

$4,922.50

$4.50

$2,475.00

*

No Bid



(000820) GALLS INC
<Quote: 00005105>0

(007456) KEL-LAC UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005106>0

(010835) SCREENPRINT PLU
<Quote: 00005107>0

(008798) RED THE UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005108>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001678

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

MEN~'S LONG SLEEVE SH
[BO]<23.0> 200-72-11001-6

95.0EA

$22.79

$2,165.05

*

$28.67

$2,723.65

$39.00

$3,705.00

$28.65

$2,721.75

MEN~'S LONG SLEEVE SH
[BO]<24.0> 200-72-11002-4

10.0EA

$24.89

$248.90

*

$28.67

$286.70

$41.00

$410.00

$34.40

$344.00

MEN~'S LONG SLEEVE SH
[BO]<25.0> 200-72-11003-2

5.0EA

$24.89

$124.45

*

$34.40

$172.00

$43.00

$215.00

$38.70

$193.50

CREW JACKET BY PORT 
[BO]<26.0> 200-72-13001-4

70.0EA

$30.99

$2,169.30

$26.23

$1,836.10

*

$31.99

$2,239.30

No Bid

CREW JACKET BY PORT 
[BO]<27.0> 200-72-13002-2

15.0EA

$32.99

$494.85

$29.23

$438.45

*

$33.99

$509.85

No Bid

CREW JACKET BY PORT 
[BO]<28.0> 200-72-13003-0

5.0EA

$33.99

$169.95

$29.98

$149.90

*

$35.99

$179.95

No Bid

HEAVYWEIGHT HOODED S
[BO]<29.0> 200-72-14001-3

65.0EA

$16.25

$1,056.25

$14.31

$930.15

*

$14.98

$973.70

No Bid

HEAVYWEIGHT HOODED S
[BO]<30.0> 200-72-14002-1

45.0EA

$18.49

$832.05

$15.31

$688.95

*

$16.98

$764.10

No Bid

HEAVYWEIGHT HOODED S
[BO]<31.0> 200-72-14003-9

3.0EA

$18.49

$55.47

$16.31

$48.93

*

$17.98

$53.94

No Bid

HEAVYWEIGHT SWEATPAN
[BO]<32.0> 200-72-15001-2

85.0EA

$10.89

$925.65

$8.00

$680.00

*

$12.50

$1,062.50

No Bid

HEAVYWEIGHT SWEATPAN
[BO]<33.0> 200-72-15002-0

5.0EA

$12.89

$64.45

$11.37

$56.85

*

$14.50

$72.50

No Bid



(000820) GALLS INC
<Quote: 00005105>0

(007456) KEL-LAC UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005106>0

(010835) SCREENPRINT PLU
<Quote: 00005107>0

(008798) RED THE UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005108>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001678

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

HEAVYWEIGHT SWEATPAN
[BO]<34.0> 200-72-15003-8

40.0EA

$13.89

$555.60

$11.53

$461.20

*

$16.50

$660.00

No Bid

SPORT SHIRT WITH POC
[BO]<35.0> 200-72-17001-0

745.0EA

$12.49

$9,305.05

$10.77

$8,023.65

*

$12.64

$9,416.80

No Bid

SPORT SHIRT WITH POC
[BO]<36.0> 200-72-17002-8

135.0EA

$12.49

$1,686.15

*

$14.57

$1,966.95

$13.64

$1,841.40

No Bid

SPORT SHIRT WITH POC
[BO]<37.0> 200-72-17003-6

15.0EA

$12.49

$187.35

*

$14.97

$224.55

$14.64

$219.60

No Bid

POLO SHIRTS, SIZE SM
[BO]<38.0> 200-72-23001-2

5.0EA NB

No Bid $26.07

$130.35

$22.51

$112.55

*

No Bid

POLO SHIRTS, SIZE XX
[BO]<39.0> 200-72-23002-0

5.0EA NB

No Bid $26.07

$130.35

$24.51

$122.55

*

No Bid

POLO SHIRTS, SIZE XX
[BO]<40.0> 200-72-23003-8

5.0EA NB

No Bid $26.07

$130.35

$25.51

$127.55

*

No Bid

COVERALLS FOR FIREFI
[BO]<41.0> 200-72-25001-0

45.0EA

$50.99

$2,294.55

$49.30

$2,218.50

*

$54.00

$2,430.00

No Bid

COVERALLS FOR FIREFI
[BO]<42.0> 200-72-25002-8

10.0EA

$50.99

$509.90

$49.30

$493.00

*

$56.00

$560.00

No Bid

COVERALLS FOR FIREFI
[BO]<43.0> 200-72-25003-6

3.0EA

$50.99

$152.97

*

$53.55

$160.65

$58.00

$174.00

No Bid

WINDBREAKER FOR FIRE
[BO]<44.0> 200-72-26001-9

105.0EA

$7.99

$838.95

*

$12.50

$1,312.50

$18.24

$1,915.20

$11.90

$1,249.50



(000820) GALLS INC
<Quote: 00005105>0

(007456) KEL-LAC UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005106>0

(010835) SCREENPRINT PLU
<Quote: 00005107>0

(008798) RED THE UNIFORM
<Quote: 00005108>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001678

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

WINDBREAKER FOR FIRE
[BO]<45.0> 200-72-26002-7

30.0EA

$9.99

$299.70

*

$14.37

$431.10

$19.24

$577.20

$13.00

$390.00

WINDBREAKER FOR FIRE
[BO]<46.0> 200-72-26003-5

5.0EA

$9.99

$49.95

*

$14.37

$71.85

$21.24

$106.20

$14.50

$72.50

BAG FOR FIREFIGHTERS
[BO]<47.0> 200-72-27001-8

5.0EA

$62.00

$310.00

$31.85

$159.25

*

$62.00

$310.00

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$90,122.99

$0.00

$0.00

$84,413.93

$0.00

$0.00

$115,172.29

$0.00

$0.00

$50,411.00

$0.00

$0.00


