
MFG MODEL / PART # / ITEM DESCRIPTION

GROUP O

BID OPENING:  August 19, 2011 at 2:00 p.m.
LOCATION:   Conference Room

BUSINESS INTERIORS OF TEXAS
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX

DELV DAYS / 
WEEKS ARO

UNIT 
COST / 
ITEM TOTAL COST

DELV DAYS / 
WEEKS ARO

UNIT 
COST / 
ITEM TOTAL COST

UNIT 
COST / 
ITEM TOTAL COST

HARLINGEN, TX 

DELV DAYS / 
WEEKS AROQTY UOM

 TX MAS CONTRACT PRICING

No B
id

PROJECT NO: 08-11-P49-117 PURCHASE, DELIVERY, ASSEMBLY, SET-UP, AND INSTALLATION OF FFE ITEMS AND DISPOSAL OF ASSOCIATED DEBRIS

GROUP/ 
CODE

BIDDERS
LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION

ARGYLE, TX
VALLEY DESIGNS, INC

45A Fixtures Furniture #SI11284A-A and #SI11284A-C 3 EA 12-14 WK $368.08 $1,104.24 $643.79 $1,931.37

45B Fixtures Furniture #SI11284A-A and #SI11284A-D 5 EA 12-14 WK $368.08 $1,840.40 $643.79 $3,218.95

45C Fixtures Furniture #SI11284A-B and #SI11284A-E 2 EA 12-14 WK $452.40 $904.80 $819.41 $1,638.82
45D Fixtures Furniture #SI11284A-B and #01005 6 EA 12-14 WK $452.40 $2,714.40 $819.41 $4,916.46
64A1 Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-A 2 EA 12-14 WK $564.10 $1,128.20 $572.72 $1,145.44
64A2 Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-C 2 EA 12-14 WK $564.10 $1,128.20 $572.72 $1,145.44
64A3 Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-E 2 EA 12-14 WK $564.10 $1,128.20 $572.72 $1,145.44
64A4 Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-G 2 EA 12-14 WK $482.36 $964.72 $489.73 $979.46
64B1 Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-B 2 EA 12-14 WK $694.22 $1,388.44 $704.83 $1,409.66
64B2 Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-D 2 EA 12-14 WK $694.22 $1,388.44 $704.83 $1,409.66
64B3 Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-F 2 EA 12-14 WK $694.22 $1,388.44 $704.83 $1,409.66
64B4 Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-H 2 EA 12-14 WK $611.61 $1,223.22 $620.96 $1,241.92

64 Fixtures Furniture #TG Gang, Steel 32 EA 12-14 WK $14.12 $451.84 $14.34 $458.88
64C Fixtures Furniture #SI10445C-I Saturn Top, Reveal Legs 2 EA 12-14 WK $584.22 $1,168.44 $637.03 $1,274.06
84A Fixtures Furniture #LNCAB60R Dewey Media Cabinet 1 EA 12-14 WK $740.87 $740.87 $752.19 $752.19
84B Fixtures Furniture #LNCAB60L Dewey Media Cabinet 1 EA 12-14 WK $740.87 $740.87 $752.19 $752.19

COM MATERIAL Wilsonart Custom Laminate 1 EA $2,864.40 $2,864.40
TXMAS S.B. FEE 1.5228% of SELL 1 EA $295.48

$150.00 $178.61 NO BID
$3,332.00 $700.00 NO BID

$26,045.60 $25,708.21 NO BID

GROUP BB (Alternate #1)
099 Raspberry Med Concert Modular Wall System 1 EA 6-9 WKS $30,786.70 $30,786.70 $34,020.00 $34,020.00

$750.00 NO BID Included
$3,832.00 NO BID Included

$35,368.70 NO BID $34,020.00GROUP BB (Alternate #1) TOTAL:

BID BOND INCLUDED

$61,414.30
NOT ACKNOWLEDGED

BID BOND
ACKNOWLEDGED

NOT SUBMITTED

$25,708.21

GROUP O TOTAL:

ADDENDUM(S) ACKNOWLEDGED
BID BOND

(IF NOT ALREADY INCLUDED IN UNIT COST)  FREIGHT:
LABOR COSTS TO INSTALL/SET-UP AND DISPOSE OF DEBRIS:

GRAND TOTAL ALL GROUPS $34,020.00

(IF NOT ALREADY INCLUDED IN UNIT COST)  FREIGHT:
LABOR COSTS TO INSTALL/SET-UP AND DISPOSE OF DEBRIS:

        LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION - 50% DEPOSIT DUE UPON ORDER ENTRY, 50% DEPOSIT DUE UPON COMPLETION OF INSTALLATION  

No B
id

NO BID
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