
H & V EQUIPMENT, INC. ANDERSON EQUIPMENT CO.
DOGGETT HEAVY 

MACHINERY SERVICES HOLT CAT

BIDDERS PROGRESO, TX PHARR, TX PHARR, TX WESLACO, TX

ITEM NO. 1 ‐ PURCHASE OF ONE (1) NEW CM WHEEL LOADER

YEAR:  2011 2011 2011 2011

MANUFACTURER:  DOOSAN LIUGONG JOHN DEERE CATERPILLAR

MODEL:  DL200 842 III 524K 928 HZ

AMOUNT BID:  $90,563.00 $105,283.00 $107,500.00 $124,725.00

OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT SERVICES

QUICK CONNECT COUPLER $3,867.00 $3,100.00 $4,094.00 $4,000.00

ATTACHMENT CONTROL STD INCLUDED IN BASE BID $1,687.00 $3,200.00

BID OPENING:  August 30, SEPTEMBER 02, 2011 at 4:00 p.m.
LOCATION:   Conference Room

Project #08‐11‐P50‐59 PURCHASE OF ONE (1) WHEEL LOADER

PALLET FORKS

$5,656.00
QUICK COUPLER $3,250.00 $4,094.00 $7,000.00

HEAVY BUCKET
$6,312.00

QUICK COUPLER $2,000.00 $7,144.00
$6,900.00

QUICK CONNECT

STANDARD HEAVY BUCKET
$6,312.00

PIN‐ON INCLUDED IN BASE BID NOT SPECIFIED $6,900.00

EXTENDED WARRANTY
$2,935.00

3 YR. / 5,000 HR.

$5,705.00 
ADDITIONAL 3 YEARS, FULL 

MACHINE
TOTAL 48 MONTHS/5000 HRS. 

$0 DEDUCTIBLE NOT SPECIFIED NOT REQUIRED ON BID

PALLET FORKS NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED $7,000.00

NO. OF DAYS TO DELIVERY ARO:  30 TO 60 DAYS 60‐90 DAYS ARO NOT SPECIFIED 60 DAYS

ITEM NO. 2 ‐ PURCHASE OF ONE (1) PRE‐OWNED WHEEL LOADER

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

YEAR:  

MANUFACTURER:  

MODEL:  
AMOUNT BID:  

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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H & V EQUIPMENT, INC. ANDERSON EQUIPMENT CO.
DOGGETT HEAVY 

MACHINERY SERVICES HOLT CAT

BIDDERS PROGRESO, TX PHARR, TX PHARR, TX WESLACO, TX

BID OPENING:  August 30, SEPTEMBER 02, 2011 at 4:00 p.m.
LOCATION:   Conference Room

Project #08‐11‐P50‐59 PURCHASE OF ONE (1) WHEEL LOADER

OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT SERVICES

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

QUICK CONNECT COUPLER

ATTACHMENT CONTROL

PALLET FORKS
HEAVY BUCKET

STANDARD HEAVY BUCKET

EXTENDED WARRANTY

NO. OF DAYS TO DELIVERY ARO:  

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM NO. 3 ‐ REFURBISHING OF ONE (1) WHEEL LOADER

TOTAL COST TO REFURBISH:  $48,500.00

NO. OF DAYS TO REFURBISH:  90 DAYS

ADDENDUM NO. 1 ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED

BID BOND CASHIER'S CHECK CASHIER'S CHECK CASHIER'S CHECK BID BOND

NOT SPECIFIED NO BIDNO BID
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