
(003977) AIRGAS-SOU
<Quote: 00005618>0

(000105) ALLEN INDUSTRIA
<Quote: 00005619>0

(012610) AMERICAN INDUST
<Quote: 00005620>0

(000374)
BWI-SCHULENBURG
<Quote: 00005621>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001837

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

FILTER, POLYESTER FI
[BO]<01.0> 031-45-09001-9

120.0ROLL NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Gloves, Latex Large 
[BPO]<02.0> 200-15-01001-8

1600.0BX

$6.76

$10,816.00

$6.925

$11,080.00

$6.15

$9,840.00

$6.90

$11,040.00

Gloves, Latex Medium
[BPO]<03.0> 200-15-01002-6

700.0BX

$6.76

$4,732.00

$6.925

$4,847.50

$6.15

$4,305.00

$6.90

$4,830.00

GLOVES, DOUBLE LEATH
[BPO]<04.0> 201-42-01001-4

2400.0PR

$1.37

$3,288.00

$1.728

$4,147.20

$1.32

$3,168.00

$2.77

$6,648.00

GLOVES, PREMIUM RUBB
[BPO]<05.0> 201-42-01004-8

280.0PR

$1.29

$361.20

$2.573

$720.44

NB

No Bid $1.19

$333.20

*

BATTERIES, AA, ALKAL
[BPO]<06.0> 287-12-01001-7

550.0PKG

$2.78

$1,529.00

$2.975

$1,636.25

$7.20

$3,960.00

NB

No Bid

Tape, Measure Unilok
[BPO]<07.0> 305-60-01001-6

36.0EA

$13.16

$473.76

$5.188

$186.77

*

$10.80

$388.80

NB

No Bid

Helmet, Safety, Whit
[BPO]<08.0> 345-56-01001-4

120.0EA

$9.86

$1,183.20

NB

No Bid $6.30

$756.00

NB

No Bid

GLASSES, CLEAR SAFET
[BPO]<09.0> 345-64-01001-4

140.0EA

$1.85

$259.00

$2.089

$292.46

$2.26

$316.40

$5.25

$735.00

Flag, 18x18 Hand, Fl
[BPO]<10.0> 350-60-01001-0

100.0EA

$2.04

$204.00

$1.725

$172.50

*

$2.87

$287.00

NB

No Bid

BLADE, HACKSAW BIMET
[BPO]<11.0> 445-58-01006-0

200.0EA

$1.22

$244.00

* NB

No Bid $1.55

$310.00

NB

No Bid



(003977) AIRGAS-SOU
<Quote: 00005618>0

(000105) ALLEN INDUSTRIA
<Quote: 00005619>0

(012610) AMERICAN INDUST
<Quote: 00005620>0

(000374)
BWI-SCHULENBURG
<Quote: 00005621>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001837

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Pitch Fork, 6-Tine (
[BPO]<12.0> 445-61-01010-7

30.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $34.82

$1,044.60

$20.00

$600.00

Hose, Garden 5/8"x50
[BPO]<13.0> 460-30-01001-4

40.0EA

$19.14

$765.60

$12.75

$510.00

$15.69

$627.60

$19.00

$760.00

Cones, Traffic 28" w
[BO]<14.0> 550-78-01002-6

1200.0EA

$16.68

$20,016.00

NB

No Bid $13.31

$15,972.00

NB

No Bid

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<15.0> 800-16-01003-7

48.0PR

$9.76

$468.48

$11.281

$541.49

$8.50

$408.00

*

$16.32

$783.36

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<16.0> 800-16-01004-5

48.0PR

$9.76

$468.48

$11.281

$541.49

$8.50

$408.00

*

$16.32

$783.36

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<17.0> 800-16-01005-2

48.0PR

$9.76

$468.48

$11.281

$541.49

$8.50

$408.00

*

$16.32

$783.36

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<18.0> 800-16-01006-0

48.0PR

$9.76

$468.48

$11.281

$541.49

$8.50

$408.00

*

$16.32

$783.36

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$45,745.68

$0.00

$244.00

$25,759.08

$0.00

$359.27

$42,607.40

$0.00

$2,388.00

$28,079.64

$0.00

$333.20



(000382) C  S SAFETY SU
<Quote: 00005622>0

(001059) PLEZALL WI
<Quote: 00005623>0

(007339) CHANN SAFE
<Quote: 00005624>0

(000634) DELTA SPEC
<Quote: 00005625>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001837

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

FILTER, POLYESTER FI
[BO]<01.0> 031-45-09001-9

120.0ROLL

$42.00

$5,040.00

* NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Gloves, Latex Large 
[BPO]<02.0> 200-15-01001-8

1600.0BX NB

No Bid $5.25

$8,400.00

$9.75

$15,600.00

NB

No Bid

Gloves, Latex Medium
[BPO]<03.0> 200-15-01002-6

700.0BX NB

No Bid $5.25

$3,675.00

$9.75

$6,825.00

NB

No Bid

GLOVES, DOUBLE LEATH
[BPO]<04.0> 201-42-01001-4

2400.0PR

$1.34

$3,216.00

$1.83

$4,392.00

$1.2417

$2,980.01

* NB

No Bid

GLOVES, PREMIUM RUBB
[BPO]<05.0> 201-42-01004-8

280.0PR

$2.05

$574.00

$2.58

$722.40

$1.97

$551.60

NB

No Bid

BATTERIES, AA, ALKAL
[BPO]<06.0> 287-12-01001-7

550.0PKG NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $2.40

$1,320.00

NB

No Bid

Tape, Measure Unilok
[BPO]<07.0> 305-60-01001-6

36.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $11.75

$423.00

NB

No Bid

Helmet, Safety, Whit
[BPO]<08.0> 345-56-01001-4

120.0EA

$7.95

$954.00

$11.7233

$1,406.80

$10.65

$1,278.00

NB

No Bid

GLASSES, CLEAR SAFET
[BPO]<09.0> 345-64-01001-4

140.0EA

$3.05

$427.00

$1.25

$175.00

*

$1.85

$259.00

NB

No Bid

Flag, 18x18 Hand, Fl
[BPO]<10.0> 350-60-01001-0

100.0EA

$2.40

$240.00

NB

No Bid $1.75

$175.00

$2.50

$250.00

BLADE, HACKSAW BIMET
[BPO]<11.0> 445-58-01006-0

200.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $1.45

$290.00

NB

No Bid



(000382) C  S SAFETY SU
<Quote: 00005622>0

(001059) PLEZALL WI
<Quote: 00005623>0

(007339) CHANN SAFE
<Quote: 00005624>0

(000634) DELTA SPEC
<Quote: 00005625>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001837

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Pitch Fork, 6-Tine (
[BPO]<12.0> 445-61-01010-7

30.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $18.65

$559.50

NB

No Bid

Hose, Garden 5/8"x50
[BPO]<13.0> 460-30-01001-4

40.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Cones, Traffic 28" w
[BO]<14.0> 550-78-01002-6

1200.0EA

$15.40

$18,480.00

NB

No Bid $12.55

$15,060.00

$12.29

$14,748.00

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<15.0> 800-16-01003-7

48.0PR

$11.95

$573.60

$13.00

$624.00

$9.50

$456.00

NB

No Bid

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<16.0> 800-16-01004-5

48.0PR

$11.95

$573.60

$13.00

$624.00

$9.50

$456.00

NB

No Bid

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<17.0> 800-16-01005-2

48.0PR

$11.95

$573.60

$13.00

$624.00

$9.50

$456.00

NB

No Bid

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<18.0> 800-16-01006-0

48.0PR

$11.95

$573.60

$13.00

$624.00

$9.50

$456.00

NB

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$31,225.40

$0.00

$0.00

$21,267.20

$0.00

$175.00

$47,145.11

$0.00

$2,980.01

$14,998.00

$0.00

$0.00



(005383) INTERBORO PACKA
<Quote: 00005626>0

(012922) LAWSON
PRODUCTS

<Quote: 00005627>0

(008155) MOTION INDUSTRI
<Quote: 00005628>0

(002578) PATHMARK T
<Quote: 00005629>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001837

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

FILTER, POLYESTER FI
[BO]<01.0> 031-45-09001-9

120.0ROLL NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $43.84

$5,260.80

NB

No Bid

Gloves, Latex Large 
[BPO]<02.0> 200-15-01001-8

1600.0BX

$4.50

$7,200.00

*

$7.72

$12,352.00

$6.29

$10,064.00

NB

No Bid

Gloves, Latex Medium
[BPO]<03.0> 200-15-01002-6

700.0BX

$4.50

$3,150.00

*

$7.72

$5,404.00

$6.29

$4,403.00

NB

No Bid

GLOVES, DOUBLE LEATH
[BPO]<04.0> 201-42-01001-4

2400.0PR NB

No Bid $2.20

$5,280.00

$1.39

$3,336.00

NB

No Bid

GLOVES, PREMIUM RUBB
[BPO]<05.0> 201-42-01004-8

280.0PR NB

No Bid $1.92

$537.60

$3.26

$912.80

NB

No Bid

BATTERIES, AA, ALKAL
[BPO]<06.0> 287-12-01001-7

550.0PKG NB

No Bid $0.90

$495.00

*

$8.40

$4,620.00

NB

No Bid

Tape, Measure Unilok
[BPO]<07.0> 305-60-01001-6

36.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Helmet, Safety, Whit
[BPO]<08.0> 345-56-01001-4

120.0EA NB

No Bid $6.50

$780.00

$3.80

$456.00

* NB

No Bid

GLASSES, CLEAR SAFET
[BPO]<09.0> 345-64-01001-4

140.0EA NB

No Bid $2.71

$379.40

$1.94

$271.60

NB

No Bid

Flag, 18x18 Hand, Fl
[BPO]<10.0> 350-60-01001-0

100.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $3.94

$394.00

BLADE, HACKSAW BIMET
[BPO]<11.0> 445-58-01006-0

200.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid



(005383) INTERBORO PACKA
<Quote: 00005626>0

(012922) LAWSON
PRODUCTS

<Quote: 00005627>0

(008155) MOTION INDUSTRI
<Quote: 00005628>0

(002578) PATHMARK T
<Quote: 00005629>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001837

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Pitch Fork, 6-Tine (
[BPO]<12.0> 445-61-01010-7

30.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Hose, Garden 5/8"x50
[BPO]<13.0> 460-30-01001-4

40.0EA NB

No Bid $41.42

$1,656.80

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Cones, Traffic 28" w
[BO]<14.0> 550-78-01002-6

1200.0EA NB

No Bid $18.65

$22,380.00

$18.64

$22,368.00

$12.97

$15,564.00

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<15.0> 800-16-01003-7

48.0PR NB

No Bid $14.87

$713.76

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<16.0> 800-16-01004-5

48.0PR NB

No Bid $14.87

$713.76

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<17.0> 800-16-01005-2

48.0PR NB

No Bid $14.87

$713.76

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<18.0> 800-16-01006-0

48.0PR NB

No Bid $14.87

$713.76

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$10,350.00

$0.00

$0.00

$52,119.84

$0.00

$0.00

$51,692.20

$0.00

$0.00

$15,958.00

$0.00

$0.00



(001558) PYRAMID SCHOOL
<Quote: 00005630>0

(013610) SCIENCE PURCHAS
<Quote: 00005631>0

(001712) SEA GARDEN SALE
<Quote: 00005632>0

(008650) STANDARD SUPPLY
<Quote: 00005633>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001837

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

FILTER, POLYESTER FI
[BO]<01.0> 031-45-09001-9

120.0ROLL NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $95.09

$11,410.80

Gloves, Latex Large 
[BPO]<02.0> 200-15-01001-8

1600.0BX

$6.21

$9,936.00

$5.40

$8,640.00

$6.32

$10,112.00

$9.25

$14,800.00

Gloves, Latex Medium
[BPO]<03.0> 200-15-01002-6

700.0BX

$6.21

$4,347.00

$5.40

$3,780.00

$5.46

$3,822.00

$9.25

$6,475.00

GLOVES, DOUBLE LEATH
[BPO]<04.0> 201-42-01001-4

2400.0PR NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $1.28

$3,072.00

$3.50

$8,400.00

GLOVES, PREMIUM RUBB
[BPO]<05.0> 201-42-01004-8

280.0PR NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $2.046

$572.88

$6.50

$1,820.00

BATTERIES, AA, ALKAL
[BPO]<06.0> 287-12-01001-7

550.0PKG

$2.80

$1,540.00

NB

No Bid $9.41

$5,175.50

$3.50

$1,925.00

Tape, Measure Unilok
[BPO]<07.0> 305-60-01001-6

36.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $5.25

$189.00

$9.25

$333.00

Helmet, Safety, Whit
[BPO]<08.0> 345-56-01001-4

120.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $10.41

$1,249.20

$15.95

$1,914.00

GLASSES, CLEAR SAFET
[BPO]<09.0> 345-64-01001-4

140.0EA NB

No Bid $1.40

$196.00

$2.18

$305.20

$3.25

$455.00

Flag, 18x18 Hand, Fl
[BPO]<10.0> 350-60-01001-0

100.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $2.00

$200.00

$3.55

$355.00

BLADE, HACKSAW BIMET
[BPO]<11.0> 445-58-01006-0

200.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $2.95

$590.00



(001558) PYRAMID SCHOOL
<Quote: 00005630>0

(013610) SCIENCE PURCHAS
<Quote: 00005631>0

(001712) SEA GARDEN SALE
<Quote: 00005632>0

(008650) STANDARD SUPPLY
<Quote: 00005633>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001837

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Pitch Fork, 6-Tine (
[BPO]<12.0> 445-61-01010-7

30.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $16.00

$480.00

*

$42.25

$1,267.50

Hose, Garden 5/8"x50
[BPO]<13.0> 460-30-01001-4

40.0EA NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $7.55

$302.00

*

$32.85

$1,314.00

Cones, Traffic 28" w
[BO]<14.0> 550-78-01002-6

1200.0EA

$13.89

$16,668.00

NB

No Bid $11.64

$13,968.00

*

$18.75

$22,500.00

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<15.0> 800-16-01003-7

48.0PR NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $11.25

$540.00

$15.50

$744.00

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<16.0> 800-16-01004-5

48.0PR NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $11.25

$540.00

$15.50

$744.00

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<17.0> 800-16-01005-2

48.0PR NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $11.25

$540.00

$15.50

$744.00

Boots, 16" Plain Toe
[BPO]<18.0> 800-16-01006-0

48.0PR NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $11.25

$540.00

$15.50

$744.00

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$32,491.00

$0.00

$0.00

$12,616.00

$0.00

$0.00

$41,607.78

$0.00

$0.00

$76,535.30

$0.00

$0.00


