PROJECT NO.: 09-09-SP28-82 PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT

ml

OCTOBER 20, 2009 AT 3:00 P.M.
LARGE CONFERENCE ROOM

CITY OF

McALLEN

AWARDED VENDOR

BIDDERS:

EXERPLAY INC.*
U.S. COMMUNITIES
CONTRACT # 040377.09

CEDAR CREST, NM

GAMETIME C/O TOTAL
RECREATION PRODUCTS,
INC.

U.S. COMMUNITIES

CYPRESS, TX

HUNTER KNEPSHIELD OF

TEXAS, INC.**
BUYBOARD

PLANO, TX

x

NATIONAL SALES &
SUPPLY

BENSALEM, PA

* PARK PLACE

RECREATION DESIGNS

INCFF*
BUYBOARD

SAN ANTONIO, TX

PARK PLACE
RECREATION DESIGNS

INC.*#*
BUYBOARD/ALTERNATE

SAN ANTONIO, TX

PLAY IT SAFE INC.
TPASS CONTRACT #
453988

JUPITER, FL

PLAY WELL
GROUP*****
DALLAS, TX

PLAY WELL

GROUPH H#**
ALTERNATE

DALLAS, TX

T.F. HARPER & ASSOCIATES
LP
BUYBOARD 769-09, HGAC
PR11-08, CFP 09/021CG-
02, TCPN R4880

AUSTIN, TX

ITEM NO. 1 - PLAYSCAPE KC9951

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

MFR./MODEL 38404-1-1
UNIT PRICE -~ ) =
INSTALLATION | 0 ¥ 905 6.
iieccamm— S \ i

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-
2A1

RECREATION CREATIONS,

INC / #COMMT

| MIRACLE / #KC9951 2009

!jl ")E

UNIONLAND INC. /
MAI090930

PLAYWORLD / 35-9030- 1A|

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /
17-55368-1

02.00

68.00

=)70.00

ITEM NO. 2 - PLAYSCAPE KC9880-R1

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES / I

MFR./MODEL 38404-2-1
UNIT PRICE -~ s 50

J. ................
INSTALLATION b B 7 b.:..‘.‘.f.
TOTAL = g 70

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-

RECREATION CREATIONS,
INC / #COMMT B

J’"

UNIONLAND INC. /

MAHO090930
e i e
___________________ A8 el

Aﬁﬂnmsb

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /

17-55369-1
TRy e
................. =

$5e07.00

ITEM NO. 3 - PLAYSCAPE KC6073

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-

RECREATION CREATIONS,

MFR./MODEL 38404-3-1 2A5 INC / #COMMT-C

UNIT PRICE $66,844.00 $59.746.79 $41,208.30
INSTALLATION $18,463.25 $17.771.94 $14,651.84
TOTAL $85,307.25 $77.518.73 $55.860.14

MIRACLE / #KC6073

$72,389.00

NO BID

UNIONLAND INC. /

MAG090930 PLAYWORLD / 35-9030-3A
$47,100.00 $68,966.00
$14,400.00 $19,974.00
$61,500.00 $88,940.00

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /
17-55370-1

$47,245.00

$9.676.00

$56,921.00

ITEM NO. 4 - PLAYSCAPE KC5021

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

MFR./MODEL 38404-4-1

R e o
INSTALLATION J """"" %.4.
TOTAL ..... A ...... b ... ]5

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-

RECREATION CREATIONS,

MIRACLE / #KC5021 |

| )
J

UNIONLAND INC. /
MAF090930

rn

PLAYWORLD / 35-9030-4A|

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /
17-55371-1

30.00

07.00

37.00

ITEM NO. 5 - PLAYSCAPE KC6067-R2

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES / I

MFR./MODEL 38404-5-1
UNIT PRICE ~ ) ]

INSTALLATION | r axdAR
e - i

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09- |

RECREATION CREATIONS,
INC / #COMMT E

UNIONLAND INC. /
MAEO9093O

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /

17-55372-1
Ry e
................. 1 peeo

$5=251.00

ITEM NO. 6 - PLAYSCAPE KC9984-R1

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /| GAMETIME / TH-10027-09- | RECREATION CREATIONS,
MFR./MODEL 38404-6-1 2A9 INC / #COMMT-F
UNIT PRICE $50,474.14 $41,587.12 $30,118.50
INSTALLATION $14,143.60 $11,863.27 $10,708.80
TOTAL $64,617.74 $53,450.39 $40.,827.30

MIRACLE / #KC9984-R1
$45,129.00

$9.025.00
$54,154.00

UNIONLAND INC. /

NO BID

MADO090930 PLAYWORLD / 35-9030-6A
$28,190.00 $48,991.00
$8,620.00 $14,241.00
$36,810.00 $63,232.00

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /
17-55373-1

$35,986.00

$6,516.00

$42,502.00




PROJECT NO.: 09-09-SP28-82 PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT

ml

OCTOBER 20, 2009 AT 3:00 P.M.
LARGE CONFERENCE ROOM

CITY

OF

McALLEN

AWARDED VENDOR

BIDDERS:

EXERPLAY INC.*
U.S. COMMUNITIES
CONTRACT # 040377.09

CEDAR CREST, NM

GAMETIME C/O TOTAL
RECREATION PRODUCTS,
INC.

U.S. COMMUNITIES

CYPRESS, TX

HUNTER KNEPSHIELD OF

TEXAS, INC.**
BUYBOARD

PLANO, TX

x

NATIONAL SALES &
SUPPLY

BENSALEM, PA

* PARK PLACE

RECREATION DESIGNS

INCFF*
BUYBOARD

SAN ANTONIO, TX

PARK PLACE
RECREATION DESIGNS

INC.*#*
BUYBOARD/ALTERNATE

SAN ANTONIO, TX

PLAY IT SAFE INC.
TPASS CONTRACT #
453988

JUPITER, FL

PLAY WELL

GROUP*****
DALLAS, TX

PLAY WELL

GROUPH H#**
ALTERNATE

DALLAS, TX

T.F. HARPER & ASSOCIATES
LP
BUYBOARD 769-09, HGAC
PR11-08, CFP 09/021CG-
02, TCPN R4880

AUSTIN, TX

ITEM NO. 7 - PLAYSCAPE KC9922-R1

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

MFR./MODEL 38404-7-1
UNIT PRICE -~y et

INSTALLATON | 0 7 =55
B - i

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-
2A11

RECREATION CREATIONS,

INC / #COMMT G

| MIRACLE / #KC9922 Rl

|
TR

UNIONLAND INC. /
MAC090925

PLAYWORLD / 35-9030- 7B|

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /

17-55374-1

855.00

?40.00

95.00

ITEM NO. 8 - PLAYSCAPE KC5015-R1

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

MFR./MODEL 38404-8-1

UNIT PRICE 7
INSTALLATION RGN = W
FOTAL e 5

RECREATION CREATIONS,

INC / #COMMT H

]9

$20,380.

I(CPI")

UNIONLAND INC. /
MABO090925

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /
17-55375-1

22.00

12.00

=34.00

ITEM NO. 9 - PLAYSCAPE KC6068-R2

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /| GAMETIME / TH-10027-09- | RECREATION CREATIONS,
MFR./MODEL 38404-9-1 2A13 INC / #COMMT-
UNIT PRICE $38,043.72 $39,410.30 $26,723.70
INSTALLATION $10,444.30 $12,471.94 $9.341.76
TOTAL $48,488.02 $51,882.24 $36,065.46

MIRACLE / #KC6068-R2

. _——
* $8,765.00

$48,155.00

NO BID

UNIONLAND INC. /

MAA090925 PLAYWORLD / 35-92030-9A
$28,640.00 $51,109.00
$8,760.00 $14,608.00
$37,400.00 $65.,717.00

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /
17-55376-1

$29,194.00

$7,935.00

$37,129.00

ITEM NO. 10 - PLAYSCAPE KC7795

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

MFR./MODEL 38404-10-1
UNIT PRICE -~
INSTALLATON | p 7
TOTAL J A W E—

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-

2A15

RECREATION CREATIONS,

| I\/\IRACLE / #KC7795

) rf}'fﬁ

UNIONLAND INC. /
MADO090924

PLAYWORLD / 35-9030-

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /

l 7-55377-1

P24.00

123.00

47.00

ITEM NO. 11 - PLAYSCAPE KC7794-R1

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

MFR./MODEL 38404-11-1
UNIT PRICE - 4
) 2
TOTAL B S 2

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-
2A16

RECREATION CREATIONS,
INC / #COMMT-K

o |
— )|
F e

UNIONLAND INC. /
MAC090924

11A

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /
17-55387-1

800.00

83.00

183.00

ITEM NO. 12 - PLAYSCAPE KC7785

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

MFR./MODEL 38404-12-1
UNIT PRICE -~ ) s
INSTALLATION | 0 7 B
e | - i

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-
2A17

RECREATION CREATIONS,
INC / #COMI\/\T L

|
O '
R

UNIONLAND INC. /
MABO90924

12A

562.00

P61.00

23.00




PROJECT NO.: 09-09-SP28-82 PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT

ml

OCTOBER 20, 2009 AT 3:00 P.M.
LARGE CONFERENCE ROOM

CITY OF

McALLEN

AWARDED VENDOR

BIDDERS:

EXERPLAY INC.*
U.S. COMMUNITIES
CONTRACT # 040377.09

CEDAR CREST, NM

GAMETIME C/O TOTAL
RECREATION PRODUCTS,
INC.

U.S. COMMUNITIES

CYPRESS, TX

HUNTER KNEPSHIELD OF

TEXAS, INC.**
BUYBOARD

PLANO,

X

x

NATIONAL SALES &
SUPPLY

BENSALEM, PA

* PARK PLACE

RECREATION DESIGNS

INCFF*
BUYBOARD

SAN ANTONIO, TX

PARK PLACE
RECREATION DESIGNS

INC.*#*
BUYBOARD/ALTERNATE

SAN ANTONIO, TX

PLAY IT SAFE INC.
TPASS CONTRACT #
453988

JUPITER, FL

PLAY WELL

GROUP*****
DALLAS, TX

PLAY WELL

GROUPH H#**
ALTERNATE

DALLAS, TX

T.F. HARPER & ASSOCIATES
LP
BUYBOARD 769-09, HGAC
PR11-08, CFP 09/021CG-
02, TCPN R4880

AUSTIN, TX

ITEM NO. 13 - PLAYSCAPE KC5012

LANDSCAPE STRUCTURES /

GAMETIME / TH-10027-09-

RECREATION CREATIONS,

| MIRACLE / #KCSO]Q

UNIONLAND INC. /

PLAYWORLD / 35-9030- 13|

BCI BURKE COMPANY LLC /

MFR./MODEL 38404-13-1 2A18 INC / #COMMT-M | MAAO90924 17-55380-1

UNIT PRICE o \ f?{f | I'L —T ! < | ©)| 47.00
INSTALLATION J -/ 54, J ) — . $3,450 j J 15.00
dieral e Y S i SN 7 O = - At \ N 5
ITEM NO. 14 - MFR'S AGE APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE FOR PLAYSCAPE UNIT FOR 2-5 YEAR OLDS

UNIT PRICE $461.00 $830.27) $462.00 $175.00 $640.00 $689.00 $374.00
INSTALLATION $141.00 $203.57 si0000  NO BID *$6000 NO BID $175.00 $195000 NO BID $106.00
TOTAL $602.00 $1,033.79 $562.00 $235.00 $815.00 $884.00 $480.00
ITEM NO. 15 - MFR'S AGE APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE FOR PLAYSCAPE UNIT FOR 2-12 YEAR OLDS

UNIT PRICE $461.00 $830.27) $462.00 $175.00 $640.00 $698.00 $374.00
INSTALLATION $141.00 $203.57 si0000 NO BID *$6000 NO BID $175.00 $195000 NO BID $106.00
TOTAL $602.00 $1,033.79 $562.00 $235.00 $815.00 $893.00 $480.00
ITEM NO. 16 - MFR'S AGE APPROPRIATE SIGNAGE FOR PLAYSCAPE UNIT FOR 5-12 YEAR OLDS

UNIT PRICE $461.00 $830.22 $462.00 $640.00 $689.00 $374.00
INSTALLATION $141.00 $203.57 sioo0l  NO BID . NO BID $175.00 $195000 NO BID $106.00
TOTAL $602.00 $1,033.79 $562.00 $235.00 $815.00 $884.00 $480.00
ITEM NO. 17 - ARCHED SWINGS 8 TOP RAIL WITH TWO BUCKET SEATS

UNIT PRICE $2,532.00) $2,650.73 $1,562.40 $1,743.00 $1,260.00 $2,809.00 $1,784.00
INSTALLATION $728.00 $663.27 s550000  NO BID * """"""""""""""" 3450000 NO BID $385.00 $790000 NO BID $507.00
TOTAL $3,260.00 $3.314.00 $2.112.40 $2,193.00 $1.645.00 $3,599.00 $2.291.00
ITEM NO. 18 - ARCHED SWINGS 8 TOP RAIL WITH TWO BELT SEATS

UNIT PRICE $2,162.00) $2,504.45 $1,517.40) $1,665.00 $1,120.00 $2,473.00 $1,629.00
INSTALLATION $591.00 $663.27 $550000  NO BID * """"""""""""""" 3450000 NO BID $385.00 3695000 NO BID $507.00
TOTAL $2.753.00 $3.167.72 $2.067.40 $2,175.00 $1,505.00 $3,168.00 $2,136.00
ITEM NO. 19 - ADD-A-BAY ARCHED SWING ASSEMBLY WITH TWO BELT SEATS

UNIT PRICE $1,419.00) $1,913.50 $821.25 $901.00 $800.00 $1,856.00 $1,254.00
INSTALLATION $434.00 $482.14 $550000  NO BID * """"""""""""""" 300000 NO BID $225.00 $522000 NO BID $507.00
TOTAL $1,853.00 $2,395.66 $1,371.25 $1,201.00 $1,025.00 $2,378.00 $1,761.00




PROJECT NO.: 09-09-SP28-82 PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT

ml

OCTOBER 20, 2009 AT 3:00 P.M.
LARGE CONFERENCE ROOM

CITY OF

McALLEN

AWARDED VENDOR

x

* PARK PLACE

T.F. HARPER & ASSOCIATES

GAMETIME C/O TOTAL PARK PLACE Lp
EXERPLAY INC.*  |RECREATION PRODUCTS,| HUNTER KNEPSHIELD OF RECREATION DESIGNS | RECREATION DESIGNS | p| oy [T SAFE INC. PLAYWELL | gjyBOARD 769-09, HGAC
U.S. COMMUNITIES INC. TEXAS, INC.** NATIONAL SALES & INC.*** INC.F** TPASS CONTRACT # PLAY WELL GROUP* ™ ** | pR11.08, CFP 09/021CG-
CONTRACT # 040377.09 U.S. COMMUNITIES BUYBOARD SUPPLY BUYBOARD BUYBOARD/ALTERNATE 453988 GROUP ##** ALTERNATE 02, TCPN R4880

BIDDERS: CEDAR CREST, NM CYPRESS, TX PLANO, TX BENSALEM, PA SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX JUPITER, FL DALLAS, TX DALLAS, TX AUSTIN, TX
ITEM NO. 20 - BOUND RUBBER MULCH SURFACING MATERIAL
1-1/2" THICK UNIT
PRICE PER S.F. $9.39 $14.29 $8.63 $4.21 $6.35 $6.60 $7.20 $9.80) $13.50] $8.85
INSTALLATION INCLUDED NOT SPECIFIED INCLUDED (4,396 SF) * $2.25 / SF $4.20 / SF $3.60 $1.50 INCLUDED INCLUDED $5.65)
TOTAL $9.38 $14.29 $8.63 $6.46 $10.55 $10.20 $8.70 $9.80) $13.50 $14.50
2" THICK UNIT PRICE
PER S.F. $10.32 $14.29 $8.94 $4.99) $7.05 $7.43 $7.70 $10.25 $13.78 $9.24
INSTALLATION INCLUDED NOT SPECIFIED INCLUDED (1,805 SF) * $2.25 / SF $4.20 / SF $3.60 $1.50 INCLUDED INCLUDED $5.65)
TOTAL $10.32 $14.29 $8.94] $7.24 $11.25 $11.03 $9.20 $10.25 $13.78 $14.89
2-1/2" THICK UNIT
PRICE PER S.F. $10.93 $14.29 $9.75 $6.02) $7.95 $8.09) $8.55 $11.21 $14.30, $10.11
INSTALLATION INCLUDED NOT SPECIFIED INCLUDED (10,559 SF) * $2.25 / SF $4.20 / SF $3.60 $1.50 INCLUDED INCLUDED $5.65]
TOTAL $10.93 $14.29 $9.75 $8.27 $12.15 $11.69 $10.09) $11.21 $14.30 $15.7¢
3" THICK UNIT PRICE
PER S.F. $11.69 $14.29 $10.50 $7.05 $9.31 $9.36 $9.35 $11.32 $14.68 $10.21
INSTALLATION INCLUDED NOT SPECIFIED INCLUDED (8,566 SF) * $2.25 / SF $4.20 / SF $3.60 $1.50 INCLUDED INCLUDED $5.65]
TOTAL $11.69 $14.29 $10.50 $9.30 $13.51 $12.96 $10.89) $11.32 $14.68 $15.84
3-1/2" THICK UNIT
PRICE PER S.F. $12.44) $14.29 $11.32 $7.83 $10.75 $9.99) $10.00] $12.06 $14.78 $10.88
INSTALLATION INCLUDED NOT SPECIFIED INCLUDED (4,873 SF) * $2.25 / SF $4.20 /SF $3.60 $1.50 INCLUDED INCLUDED $5.65]
TOTAL $12.44 $14.29 $11.32 $10.08 $14.95 $13.59 $11.50 $12.06 $14.78 $16.53
DELIVERY 3-4 WEEKS 45 DAYS 45-60 DAYS 14-21 DAYS NOT SPECIFIED NOT SPECIFIED 60 DAYS 45 DAYS 46 DAYS 120 DAYS (FOR ALL ITEMS)
ADDENDUM NO. 1 ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED NOT ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED |ACKNOWLEDGED) ACKNOWLEDGED
ADDENDUM NO. 2 ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED NOT ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED | NOT ACKNOWLEDGED| ACKNOWLEDGED |ACKNOWLEDGED ACKNOWLEDGED

*EXERPLAY, INC. - ITEM. NO 1 - INCLUDES 6% DISC. AND FREIGHT

**HUNTER KNEPSHIELD OF TEXAS, INC. - ITEM NO. 20-CHANGED SPEC TO 1-3/4" THICK, NOTES: 1) SURFACE AMERICA PLAYBOUND POURED IN PLACE SYSTEM IS IPEMA CERTIFIED. 2) TOP SURFACE APPLIED @ INDUSTRY LEADING RATE OF 2.44 LBS/SF. 3) 1-
3/4" SYSTEM MEETS 4' FALL HEIGHT. 4) 2" SYSTEM MEETS &' FALL HEIGHT. 5) 2-1/2" SYSTEM MEETS é' FALL HEIGHT. é) 3" SYSTEM MEETS 7' FALL HEIGHT. 7) 3-1/2" SYSTEM MEETS 8' FALL HEIGHT. 8) PURCHASER SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR SECURITY. 9) PRICED FOR
TWO MOBILIZATIONS FOR INSTALL. ALL AREAS MUST BE ORDERED AT THE SAME TIME. MATERIALS SHIPMENTS AND INSTALLATIONS MUST OCCUR IN NO MORE THAN TWO MOBILIZATIONS (30,199 SF). 10) NO GRAPHICS INCLUDED IN PRICE. 11) PRICE VALID
120 DAYS FROM DATE QUOTE IS PROVIDED.

*#*p ARK PLACE RECREATION DESIGNS, INC. - ITEM NO. 20-NO WARRANTY ON "MATERIALS ONLY" PURCHASES, INSTALLATION BY MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFIED CREW CARRIES A 5 YEAR WARRANTY
*#*PARK PLACE RECREATION DESIGNS, INC. (ALTERNATE) - ITEM NO. 20-SPEC CHANGED-POURED-IN-PLACE RUBBER SURFACING, NO WARRANTY ON "MATERIALS ONLY" PURCHASES, INSTALLATION BY MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFIED CREW CARRIES A 5 YEAR

WARRANTY

AP ARK WELL GROUP - LIFETIME LIMITED WARRANTY ON PLAY SYSTEMS, ITEM NO. 20-3 YR WARRANTY, NO TESTING IS INCLUDED
4P ARK WELL GROUP (ALTERNATE) - ITEM NO. 20-SPEC CHANGED-P/P 50/50, 5 YR WARRANTY, NO TESTING IS INCLUDED, CONCRETE ONLY BASE PRICE - $5.00/SF, CONCRETE BASE W/ SUBGRADE COMPACTION OF 90% - $8.75/SF




