* AWARDED VENDORS

PROJECT #09-11-S71-57

ml

TESTING SERVICES FOR BACKFLOW DEVICES
BID OPENING: October 19, 2011 at 3:00 p.m.
COMMISSION CHAMBERS (3RD FLOOR)

CITY OF

McALLEN

revised: 12/1/11..cs

SOUTH kALLIANCE

* L& M TEXAS PECIALIZED ALLIED FIRE 1st FP ALL STAR
BIDDERS: BACKFLOWS|BACKFLOWS| SYSTEMS | AQUA-TECH | PROTECTION | SERVICESLLC | RIO TECH PLUMBING
DESCRIPTION ALTON, TX |MISSION, TX| PHARR, TX | McALLEN, TX | MCcALLEN, TX | MCcALLEN, TX | McALLEN, TX|HARLINGEN, TX
1. REDUCED PRESSURE
PRINCIPLE ASSEMBLY (RP)
A.3/4 INCH % $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $50.00 $75.00 $135.00
B. 1INCH W $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $50.00 $75.00 $135.00
C.11/2 INCH % $35.00 $45.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $135.00
D. 2 INCH % $35.00 $45.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $75.00 $85.00 $135.00
E. 3INCH * $45.00 $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $95.00 $135.00
F. 4 INCH - 10 INCH Y $75.00 $75.00 $90.00 $100.00 $75.00 $100.00 $250.00 $135.00
T DOUBLE CHECK VALVE
ASSEMBLY (DC)
A.1/2 INCH * $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $50.00 $65.00 $135.00
B. 3/4 INCH $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $50.00 $75.00 $135.00
C. 1INCH $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $50.00 $75.00 $135.00
D.11/2 INCH $35.00 $45.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $135.00
E. 2 INCH % $35.00 $45.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $75.00 $85.00 $135.00
F. 3 INCH Y $40.00 $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $65.00 $75.00 $95.00 $135.00
G. 4 INCH P $40.00 $75.00 $75.00 $100.00 $65.00 $100.00 $125.00 $135.00
H. 6 INCH PX $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $100.00 $65.00 $100.00 $175.00 $135.00
1Il. PRESSURE VACUUM
BREAKERS (PVB)
A.3/4 INCH W $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $50.00 $65.00 $135.00
B. 1 INCH L $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $50.00 $65.00 $135.00
C.11/2 INCH Y& $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $75.00 $65.00 $135.00
D. 2 INCH X $35.00 $40.00 $59.90 $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $135.00
IV. FIRE LINE
A.2 INCH NO BID NO BID[  $50.00 NO BID $110.00 $100.00 $150.00 $135.00
B. 2 1/2 INCH NO BID NO BID[ff  $75.00 NO BID $110.00 $100.00 $150.00 $135.00
C. 3 INCH NO BID NO BID[X  $75.00 NO BID $110.00 $100.00 $150.00 $135.00
D. 4 INCH NO BID NO BID[f  $90.00 NO BID $125.00 $100.00 $200.00 $135.00
E. 8 INCH NO BID NO BID[j¥  $90.00 NO BID $125.00 $100.00 $250.00 $135.00
F. 10 INCH NO BID NO BID[y $100.00 NO BID $125.00 $100.00 $350.00 $135.00
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