PROJECT NO. 09-11-SP45-31

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001843

ITEMS IN BLUE WERE AWARDED

(013634) GCR TIRE CENTER
<Quote: 00005640>0

(008694) SOUTHERN TIRE M
<Quote: 00005641>0

(011103) ATO Z TIRE
<Quote: 00005642>0

(008694) SOUTHERN TIRE M
<Quote: 00005650>0

TIRE, PASSENGER, P22 $75.74 $74.25 $105.33 No Bid
[BPO]<01.0> 863-05-01011-7
$4,544.40 $4,455.00 $6,319.80
|EA | 60.0 * NB
TIRE, PASSENGER, P24 $93.78 $90.70 $129.16 No Bid
[BPO]<02.0> 863-05-02001-7
$1,875.60 $1,814.00 $2,583.20
|EA | 20.0 * NB
TIRE, PASSENGER, P23 $86.75 $85.30 $136.78 No Bid
[BPO]<03.0> 863-05-03001-6
$21,687.50 $21,325.00 $34,195.00
|EA | 250.0 * NB
TIRE, LIGHT TRUCK, L $99.07 $97.00 $127.19 No Bid
[BPO]<04.0> 863-07-01002-4
$3,566.52 $3,492.00 $4,578.84
|EA | 36.0 * NB
TIRE, LIGHT TRUCK, L $88.71 $87.30 $128.29 No Bid
[BPO]<05.0> 863-07-01003-2
$6,653.25 $6,547.50 $9,621.75
|EA | 75.0 & NB
TIRE, LIGHT TRUCK, L $95.96 $93.80 $147.59 No Bid
[BPO]<06.0> 863-07-01005-7
$3,838.40 $3,752.00 $5,903.60
|EA | 40.0 & NB
TIRE, LIGHT TRUCK, L $104.68 $102.50 $160.01 No Bid
[BPO]<07.0> 863-07-01006-5
$5,234.00 $5,125.00 $8,000.50
|EA | 50.0 * NB
TIRE, LIGHT TRUCK, L $124.94 $121.80 $183.09 No Bid
[BPO]<08.0> 863-07-01008-1
$2,498.80 $2,436.00 $3,661.80
|EA | 20.0 * NB
TIRE, MEDIUM TRUCK/B $225.56 $221.50 $160.52 No Bid
[BPO]<09.0> 863-10-01001-1
$8,120.16 $7,974.00 $5,778.72
|EA | 36.0 * NB
TIRE, MEDIUM TRUCK/B $301.11 $296.50 $256.40 No Bid
[BPO]<10.0> 863-10-01004-5
$168,621.60 $166,040.00 $143,584.00
|EA | 560.0 * NB
TIRE, MEDIUM TRUCK/B $310.92 $306.80 $271.47 No Bid
[BPO]<11.0> 863-10-02001-0
$12,436.80 $12,272.00 $10,858.80

|EA | 40.0

NB
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Bid Tab for Bid# 00001843

(013634) GCR TIRE CENTER
<Quote: 00005640>0

(008694) SOUTHERN TIRE M
<Quote: 00005641>0

(011103) ATO Z TIRE
<Quote: 00005642>0

(008694) SOUTHERN TIRE M
<Quote: 00005650>0

IRE, MEDIUM TRUCK/B $620.32 $422.50 $366.53 $409.80
[BPO]<12.0> 863-10-02003-6
$49,625.60 $33,800.00 $29,322.40 $32,784.00
|EA | 80.0 *
IRE, MEDIUM TRUCK/B $345.11 $360.40 $308.51 No Bid
[BO]<13.0> 863-10-02004-4
$10,353.30 $10,812.00 $9,255.30
|EA 30.0 * NB
IRE, MEDIUM/TRUCK/B $481.45 $477.50 $640.14 No Bid
[BO]<14.0> 863-10-03001-9
$28,887.00 $28,650.00 $38,408.40
|EA | 60.0 * NB
IRE, OFF ROAD EQUIP $125.11 $147.00 $138.47 No Bid
[BPO]<15.0> 863-15-01001-6
$1,876.65 $2,205.00 $2,077.05
|EA | 15.0 * NB
Totals: Net $ Total: $329,819.58 $310,699.50 $314,149.16 $32,784.00
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $1,876.65 $214,986.50 $16,637.52 $32,784.00
Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems






