PROJECT #09-11-SP46-170 SUPPLY CONTRACT THE PURCHASE OF FIRE FIGHTER UNIFORMS
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CITY OF

McALLEN

September 29, 2011 at 2:00 p.m.
Conference Room

ABSOLUTE SCREEN
PREVIOUS KEL-LAC PRINTING MODEL LAUNDRY LLC A & L ATHLETICS CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC
BIDDERS PRICING SAN ANTONIO, TX BUCKEYE, AZ LOS INDIOS, TX MCALLEN, TX HOUSTON, TX
ITEM NO. 1: UNIFORM TROUSERS - HORACE SMALL 2313
BRAND/STYLE: HS2313 HS2313 HS2313 HS2313
SIZE 30 OR LESS
$22.29 $32.17 $32.25 $49.50 5 GED
SIZE 31 TO 48 $22.29 $32.17 $32.25 $44.55
SIZE 50 OR LARGER $24.64 $32.17 $32.25 $44.55
ITEM NO. 2: POLYESTER UNIFORM TROUSERS - HORACE SMALL 2149
BRAND/STYLE: HS2149 HS2149 HS2149 HS2149
SIZE 30 OR LESS
$23.99 $34.05 $33.85 $53.00 55 GED
SIZE 31 TO 48 $23.99 $34.05 $33.85 $53.00
SIZE 50 OR LARGER $26.49 $34.05 $33.85 $63.60
ITEM NO. 3: MEN'S SHORT SLEEVE NEW DIMENSION® STRETCH POPLIN SHIRT - HORACE SMALL 1210
BRAND/STYLE: HS1210 HS1210 HS1210 HS1210
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $20.19 $29.90 $30.50 $40.25 NO BID NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $21.99 $29.90 | $30.50 i $50.60
SIZE XXX-LARGE $21.99 $29.90 $30.50 $55.20
ITEM NO. 4: CLASS "C" POCKET T-SHIRT
BRAND/STYLE: FOL BEST 5930P 3930 PR JERZEES FRUIT OF THE LOOM
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $3.27 $5.56 $7.27 $13.36 $5.85 NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $4.90 $5.56 $9.22 $16.68 $6.95
SIZE XXX-LARGE $4.90 $5.56 $9.37 $16.68 $7.95
ITEM NO. 5: TRAINER EXERCISE SHORT - BADGER BT5 TECH STYLE 4110
BRAND/STYLE: AUGUSTA 990!  AUGUSTA 803 BT5 4110 SPORT-TEK BADGER BT5
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $6.28 $12.57 $14.65 $18.98 $18.00 NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $7.34 $12.57 $16.15 $18.98 $20.00
SIZE XXX-LARGE $8.08 $12.57 $17.65 $18.98 $21.00
ITEM NO. 6: TWILL WEAVE SHORTS - BLAUER STREETGEAR 8841
PROPPER
BRAND/STYLE: F5233 STREETGEAR 8841
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $23.32 $27.13 $65.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $23.32 $27.13 $65.80
SIZE XXX-LARGE $23.32 $27.13 $68.00
ITEM NO. 7: UNIFORM BELT - DUTY MAN 1611T
BRAND/STYLE: ROTHCO ROTHCO 6001
SIZE 30 OR LESS
B $11.24 $15.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIZE 31 TO 48 $11.11 $11.24 $15.99
SIZE 50 OR LARGER $11.11 $11.24 i $15.99
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ITEM NO. 8: BASEBALL CAP - RICHARDSON PRO 512W
PORT AUTH
BRAND/STYLE: CP81 PRO 512W 514 PORT AUTHORITY RICHARDSON
CAP, BASEBALL CAP, NO BID
RICHARDSON PRO
512W $4.50 $13.42 $12.00 $9.58 $11.00
ITEM NO. 9: MEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT - HORACE SMALL (HS1114-LIGHT BLUE, HS1116 WHITE)
HS1114/HS1
BRAND/STYLE: 116 HS1114 /HS1116 | HS1114/HS1116 | HORACE SMALL
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $22.79 $33.41 $33.50 $45.50 NO BID NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $24.89 $34.41 $33.50 $59.80
SIZE XXX-LARGE $24.89 $35.41 $33.50 $59.80
ITEM NO. 10: CREW JACKET - PORT AUTHORITY J755
HARRINGTO
BRAND/STYLE: NM740 {HARRINGTON M740 PORT AUTHORITY
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $26.23 $26.06 NO BID $54.98 NO BID NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $29.23 $26.06 $64.97
SIZE XXX-LARGE $29.98 $26.06 $64.97
ITEM NO. 11: HEAVY WEIGHT HOODED SWEATSHIRT - PORT & COMPANY PC90ZH
JERZEE
BRAND/STYLE: 4997M PC90ZH PC90ZH PORT & COMPANY | PORT & COMPANY
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $14.31 $21.90 $20.49 $30.98 $22.00 NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $15.31 $22.90 $21.67 $37.17 $24.00
SIZE XXX-LARGE $16.31 $23.90 $24.06 $37.17 $26.00
ITEM NO. 12: SWEATPANTS - PORT & COMPANY PC90P
JERZEE
BRAND/STYLE: 973M PC90P PC90P PORT & COMPANY | PORT & COMPANY
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $8.00 $14.47 $17.49 $22.98 $16.00 NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $11.37 $14.47 $18.49 $27.57 $18.00
SIZE XXX-LARGE $11.53 $16.47 $20.49 $27.57 $20.00
ITEM NO. 13: SPORT SHIRT WITH POCKET - JERZEE ACTIVE WEAR 436MP
JERZEE
BRAND/STYLE: 436MP 436MP 436MP JERZEE ACTIVE JERZEE WEAR 436MP
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $10.77 $10.14 $14.40 $19.80 $13.95 NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $12.49 $10.14 $14.44 $23.76 $15.95
SIZE XXX-LARGE $12.49 $11.14 $14.44 $23.76 $16.95
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ITEM NO. 14: POLO SHIRTS - PORT AUTHORITY SPORT TEK T474

PORT AUTH
BRAND/STYLE: K431 T474 T474 PORT AUTHORITY | SPORT TEK T474
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $22.51 $22.40 $19.99 $30.98 $22.95 NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $24.51 $23.40 $20.99 $37.17 $25.95
SIZE XXX-LARGE $25.51 $24.40 $22.99 $37.17 $26.95
ITEM NO. 15: COVERALLS - STANCO US9-681

BULWARK
BRAND/STYLE: CEC2NV VGCEC2NV US9-681 BULWARK
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $49.30 $53.91 $83.00 $131.82 NO BID NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $49.30 $53.91 $93.00 $158.18
SIZE XXX-LARGE $50.99 $59.37 $103.00 $158.18
ITEM NO. 16: WINDBREAKER - HARTWELL SPORTS HR201AT

GALLS
BRAND/STYLE: JA138 LIBERTY 560MNV HR201A PORT AUTHORITY | HARTWELL HR201AT
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM,
LARGE, X-LARGE $7.99 $15.07 $16.95 $54.98 $20.00 NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE $9.99 $16.07 $17.95 $65.97 $23.00
SIZE XXX-LARGE $9.99 $17.07 $18.95 $65.97 $25.00
ITEM NO. 17: FIREFIGHTER GEAR BAG - AMERICAN FIREWEAR ULTIMATE BAG B8ORS
BRAND/STYLE: KLBAG KL BAG B8ORS PORT AUTHORITY HAN-GB-15563
BAG, FIREFIGHTER
GEAR BAG, AMERICAN NO BID
FIREWEAR ULTIMATE
BAG B8ORS $31.85 $35.00 $65.00 $44.98 $48.00
ITEM NO. 18: TRU-SPEC 24-7 SERIES® MENS EMS PANTS
BRAND/STYLE: LIBERTY 630FNV 24-7 LIBERTY
SIZE 30 OR LESS | i
; ; $30.22 $40.90 $61.60 NED NOED

SIZE 31 TO 48 ; | $30.22 $45.90 $61.60
SIZE 50 OR LARGER | : $30.22 $45.90 $73.92
ITEM NO. 19: LONG SLEEVE T-SHIRT W/ POCKET - PORT & COMPANY PC61LSP
BRAND/STYLE: i ! GILDAN G241 PC61LSP PORT & COMPANY | PORT & COMPANY
SIZE SMALL, MEDIUM, | i
LARGE, X-LARGE | | $10.25 $11.30 $13.86 $10.95 NO BID
SIZE XX-LARGE i i $11.25 $12.99 $16.63 $12.95
SIZE XXX-LARGE i i $12.25 $13.60 $16.63 $13.95
ITEM NO. 20: TRU-SPEC® GEN 1l ADJUSTABLE BOONIE HAT - 3312
BRAND/STYLE: i !  TRU-SPEC | 3312' ! PORT AUTHORITY
HAT, TRU-SPEC® GEN | ;
Il ADJUSTABLE | | NOBID NOBID
BOONIE HAT, 3312 : i $14.63 $15.90 $14.98
NO. OF DAYS TO DELIVER | ;
ARO: : i 30-60 days 15-20 days NOT SPECIFIED | 10-15 WKG DAYS 30 DAYS
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