Bid Tab for Bid# 00001863

HRONIC STATIC RENEW
[BPO]<01.0> 907-83-05001-7

[EA | 1.0

HRONIC STATIC RENEW
[BPO]<02.0> 907-83-05002-5

[EA | 1.0

DAPHNIA PULEX OR CER
[BPO]<03.0> 907-83-06001-6

[EA | 1.0

PIMEPHALES PROMELAS
[BPO]<04.0> 907-83-06002-4

[EA | 1.0

[EA | 1.0

HRONIC STATIC RENEW
[BPO]<06.0> 907-83-07002-3

[EA | 1.0

DAPHNIA PULEX OR CER
[BPO]<07.0> 907-83-08001-4

[EA | 1.0

(009642) ATKINS
<Quote: 00005701>0

(009642) ATKINS
<Quote: 0000570250

(000298) BIO AQUATIC TES

<Quote: 00005703>0

(004458) BIOTOX INC
<Quote: 00005704>0

**AWARDED VENDOR**

$750.00 No Bid $550.00 $515.00
$750.00 $550.00 $515.00
NB *

$750.00 No Bid $525.00 $515.00
$750.00 $525.00 $515.00
NB *

$100.00 $250.00 $35.00 $20.00
$100.00 $250.00 $35.00 $20.00
*

$100.00 $250.00 $35.00 $20.00
$100.00 $250.00 $35.00 $20.00
*

$750.00 No Bid $550.00 $515.00
$750.00 $550.00 $515.00
NB *

$750.00 No Bid $525.00 $515.00
$750.00 $525.00 $515.00
NB *

$100.00 $250.00 $35.00 $20.00
$100.00 $250.00 $35.00 $20.00
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Bid Tab for Bid# 00001863

PIMEPHALES PROMELAS
[BPO]<08.0> 907-83-08002-2

[EA | 10
Totals: Net $ Total:
$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

(009642) ATKINS (009642) ATKINS (000298) BIO AQUATIC TES (004458) BIOTOX INC
<Quote: 00005701>0 <Quote: 00005702>0 <Quote: 00005703>0 <Quote: 00005704>0

$100.00 $250.00 $35.00 $20.00

$100.00 $250.00 $35.00 $20.00

*

$3,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,290.00 $2,140.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 $2,290.00 $0.00

Eval Codes: NI





