
(009685) RGV PHONE
COMPA

<Quote: 00005675>0

(012565) ELDRIDGE
COMMUN

<Quote: 00005676>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005677>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005678>0

(010449) AES CABLING GRO
<Quote: 00005679>0

(012483) BRIDGENET
COMMU

<Quote: 00005680>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001856

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

CAT 6(PLENUM) DROP (
[BO]<01.0> 962-18-16001-6

1.0EA

$85.00

$85.00

*

$109.00

$109.00

$130.00

$130.00

NB

No Bid $149.00

$149.00

$265.00

$265.00

CAT6(PLENUM) DROP (0
[BO]<02.0> 962-18-16002-4

1.0EA

$89.00

$89.00

*

$113.00

$113.00

$130.00

$130.00

NB

No Bid $155.00

$155.00

$275.00

$275.00

CAT 6(PLENUM) DROP (
[BO]<03.0> 962-18-16003-2

1.0EA

$104.00

$104.00

*

$152.00

$152.00

$185.00

$185.00

NB

No Bid $186.00

$186.00

$290.00

$290.00

CAT 6(PLENUM) DROP (
[BO]<04.0> 962-18-16004-0

1.0EA

$109.00

$109.00

*

$156.00

$156.00

$185.00

$185.00

NB

No Bid $192.00

$192.00

$300.00

$300.00

CAT 6(PLENUM) DROP (
[BO]<05.0> 962-18-16005-7

1.0EA

$114.00

$114.00

*

$221.00

$221.00

$295.00

$295.00

NB

No Bid $227.00

$227.00

$310.00

$310.00

CAT 6(PLENUM) DROP (
[BO]<06.0> 962-18-16006-5

1.0EA

$119.00

$119.00

*

$225.00

$225.00

$295.00

$295.00

NB

No Bid $233.00

$233.00

$315.00

$315.00

CAT 6(PLENUM) DROP (
[BO]<07.0> 962-18-16007-3

1.0EA

$125.00

$125.00

*

$296.00

$296.00

$400.00

$400.00

NB

No Bid $279.00

$279.00

$350.00

$350.00

CAT 6(PLENUM) DROP (
[BO]<08.0> 962-18-16008-1

1.0EA

$129.00

$129.00

*

$300.00

$300.00

$400.00

$400.00

NB

No Bid $285.00

$285.00

$370.00

$370.00
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(009685) RGV PHONE
COMPA

<Quote: 00005675>0

(012565) ELDRIDGE
COMMUN

<Quote: 00005676>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005677>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005678>0

(010449) AES CABLING GRO
<Quote: 00005679>0

(012483) BRIDGENET
COMMU

<Quote: 00005680>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001856

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

CAT 6(OUTDOOR RATED)
[BO]<09.0> 962-18-17001-5

1.0EA

$80.00

$80.00

*

$104.00

$104.00

$120.00

$120.00

NB

No Bid $155.00

$155.00

$265.00

$265.00

CAT6(OUTDOOR RATED) 
[BO]<10.0> 962-18-17002-3

1.0EA

$84.00

$84.00

*

$110.00

$110.00

$130.00

$130.00

NB

No Bid $161.00

$161.00

$270.00

$270.00

CAT 6(OUTDOOR RATED)
[BO]<11.0> 962-18-17003-1

1.0EA

$99.00

$99.00

*

$147.00

$147.00

$185.00

$185.00

NB

No Bid $187.00

$187.00

$280.00

$280.00

CAT 6(OUTDOOR RATED)
[BO]<12.0> 962-18-17004-9

1.0EA

$104.00

$104.00

*

$149.00

$149.00

$185.00

$185.00

NB

No Bid $193.00

$193.00

$285.00

$285.00

CAT 6(OUTDOOR RATED)
[BO]<13.0> 962-18-17005-6

1.0EA

$109.00

$109.00

*

$214.00

$214.00

$295.00

$295.00

NB

No Bid $220.00

$220.00

$300.00

$300.00

CAT 6(OUTDOOR RATED)
[BO]<14.0> 962-18-17006-4

1.0EA

$114.00

$114.00

*

$219.00

$219.00

$295.00

$295.00

NB

No Bid $226.00

$226.00

$305.00

$305.00

CAT 6(OUTDOOR RATED)
[BO]<15.0> 962-18-17007-2

1.0EA

$120.00

$120.00

*

$289.00

$289.00

$400.00

$400.00

NB

No Bid $253.00

$253.00

$325.00

$325.00

CAT 6(OUTDOOR RATED)
[BO]<16.0> 962-18-17008-0

1.0EA

$124.00

$124.00

*

$162.00

$162.00

$400.00

$400.00

NB

No Bid $259.00

$259.00

$330.00

$330.00
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(009685) RGV PHONE
COMPA

<Quote: 00005675>0

(012565) ELDRIDGE
COMMUN

<Quote: 00005676>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005677>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005678>0

(010449) AES CABLING GRO
<Quote: 00005679>0

(012483) BRIDGENET
COMMU

<Quote: 00005680>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001856

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

CAT 6A 10GBE (PLENUM
[BO]<17.0> 962-18-18001-4

1.0EA

$124.00

$124.00

*

$149.00

$149.00

$160.00

$160.00

NB

No Bid $199.00

$199.00

$280.00

$280.00

CAT6A10GBE(PLENUM) D
[BO]<18.0> 962-18-18002-2

1.0EA

$129.00

$129.00

*

$153.00

$153.00

$160.00

$160.00

NB

No Bid $205.00

$205.00

$285.00

$285.00

CAT 6A 10GBE (PLENUM
[BO]<19.0> 962-18-18003-0

1.0EA

$154.00

$154.00

*

$196.00

$196.00

$236.00

$236.00

NB

No Bid $255.00

$255.00

$300.00

$300.00

CAT6A10GBE(PLENUM) D
[BO]<20.0> 962-18-18004-8

1.0EA

$159.00

$159.00

*

$200.00

$200.00

$236.00

$236.00

NB

No Bid $301.00

$301.00

$330.00

$330.00

CAT6A10GBE(PLENUM) D
[BO]<21.0> 962-18-18005-5

1.0EA

$185.00

$185.00

*

$300.00

$300.00

$395.00

$395.00

NB

No Bid $307.00

$307.00

$360.00

$360.00

CAT6A10GBE(PLENUM) D
[BO]<22.0> 962-18-18006-3

1.0EA

$189.00

$189.00

*

$300.00

$300.00

$395.00

$395.00

NB

No Bid $313.00

$313.00

$370.00

$370.00

CAT6A10GBE(PLENUM) D
[BO]<23.0> 962-18-18007-1

1.0EA

$215.00

$215.00

*

$404.00

$404.00

NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid $388.00

$388.00

$400.00

$400.00

CAT6A10GBE(PLENUM) D
[BO]<24.0> 962-18-18008-9

1.0EA

$219.00

$219.00

*

$408.00

$408.00

$550.00

$550.00

NB

No Bid $394.00

$394.00

$410.00

$410.00
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(009685) RGV PHONE
COMPA

<Quote: 00005675>0

(012565) ELDRIDGE
COMMUN

<Quote: 00005676>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005677>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005678>0

(010449) AES CABLING GRO
<Quote: 00005679>0

(012483) BRIDGENET
COMMU

<Quote: 00005680>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001856

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

SM-FIBER (INSIDE PLA
[BO]<25.0> 962-18-20001-0

1.0FT

$3.25

$3.25

$5.80

$5.80

$1.80

$1.80

* NB

No Bid $4.50

$4.50

$3.54

$3.54

SM-FIBER (INSIDE PLA
[BO]<26.0> 962-18-20002-8

1.0FT

$4.20

$4.20

$6.60

$6.60

$3.06

$3.06

* NB

No Bid $5.25

$5.25

$5.11

$5.11

SM-FIBER (INSIDE PLA
[BO]<27.0> 962-18-20003-6

1.0FT

$7.20

$7.20

$10.60

$10.60

$5.85

$5.85

* NB

No Bid $8.00

$8.00

$8.36

$8.36

MM-FIBER (INSIDE PLA
[BO]<28.0> 962-18-21001-9

1.0FT

$4.00

$4.00

$5.00

$5.00

$2.30

$2.30

* NB

No Bid $3.70

$3.70

$3.28

$3.28

MM-FIBER (INSIDE PLA
[BO]<29.0> 962-18-21002-7

1.0FT

$5.20

$5.20

$6.30

$6.30

$3.62

$3.62

* NB

No Bid $4.60

$4.60

$4.72

$4.72

MM-FIBER (INSIDE PLA
[BO]<30.0> 962-18-21003-5

1.0FT

$7.90

$7.90

$9.80

$9.80

$7.45

$7.45

NB

No Bid $6.70

$6.70

*

$7.02

$7.02

PULL/INSTALL CITY OF
[BO]<31.0> 962-18-22001-8

1.0HR

$69.00

$69.00

$29.50

$29.50

*

$65.00

$65.00

NB

No Bid $55.00

$55.00

$55.00

$55.00

COAX RG6 PER LINEAR 
[BO]<32.0> 962-18-23001-7

1.0LFT

$1.89

$1.89

$1.65

$1.65

$2.25

$2.25

NB

No Bid $1.00

$1.00

*

$195.00

$195.00
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(009685) RGV PHONE
COMPA

<Quote: 00005675>0

(012565) ELDRIDGE
COMMUN

<Quote: 00005676>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005677>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005678>0

(010449) AES CABLING GRO
<Quote: 00005679>0

(012483) BRIDGENET
COMMU

<Quote: 00005680>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001856

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

COAX RG6 PER LINEAR 
[BO]<33.0> 962-18-23002-5

1.0LFT

$1.95

$1.95

$1.70

$1.70

$2.25

$2.25

NB

No Bid $1.05

$1.05

*

$225.00

$225.00

CAT 6 24 PORT PATCH 
[BO]<34.0> 962-18-24001-6

1.0LFT

$209.00

$209.00

$179.00

$179.00

*

$263.15

$263.15

$468.50

$468.50

$249.00

$249.00

$186.25

$186.25

CAT 6 48 PORT PATCH 
[BO]<35.0> 962-18-24002-4

1.0LFT

$419.00

$419.00

$318.00

$318.00

*

$459.41

$459.41

$789.53

$789.53

$557.00

$557.00

$361.25

$361.25

BLACK DISTRIBUTION F
[BO]<36.0> 962-18-25001-5

1.0EA

$950.00

$950.00

$316.00

$316.00

$2,000.00

$2,000.00

NB

No Bid $215.00

$215.00

*

$914.79

$914.79

BLACK DISTRIBUTION F
[BO]<37.0> 962-18-25002-3

1.0EA

$1,050.00

$1,050.00

$341.00

$341.00

$2,000.00

$2,000.00

NB

No Bid $218.00

$218.00

*

$937.84

$937.84

BLACK DISTRIBUTION W
[BO]<38.0> 962-18-25003-1

1.0EA

$380.00

$380.00

$757.00

$757.00

$600.00

$600.00

NB

No Bid $298.00

$298.00

*

$427.54

$427.54
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(009685) RGV PHONE
COMPA

<Quote: 00005675>0

(012565) ELDRIDGE
COMMUN

<Quote: 00005676>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005677>0

(007265) TURNKEY
COMMUNI

<Quote: 00005678>0

(010449) AES CABLING GRO
<Quote: 00005679>0

(012483) BRIDGENET
COMMU

<Quote: 00005680>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 00001856

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

BLACK DISTRIBUTION W
[BO]<39.0> 962-18-25004-9

1.0EA

$420.00

$420.00

$823.00

$823.00

$600.00

$600.00

NB

No Bid $322.00

$322.00

*

$473.44

$473.44

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$6,614.59

$0.00

$0.00

$7,886.95

$0.00

$0.00

$12,178.14

$0.00

$0.00

$1,258.03

$0.00

$0.00

$7,670.80

$0.00

$0.00

$11,378.14

$0.00

$0.00
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*Note: Item No. 25, 26 & 27 includes 1" innerduct and SC or LC Connector
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*NOTE 1: (Item No. 25-30) Includes fiber, fiber connectors, J-hooks, and testing, NO innerduct.
*NOTE 2: (Item No. 31)
Hourly wage: $55/hr, per tech
*NOTE 3: (Item No. 32 & 33)
PVC cable will be used
*NOTE 4: (Item No. 36 & 37)
Included: Rack, 2-Vertical wire managers, horizontal wire manager, 1-wall angle kit, and 1-ladder tray.
*NOTE: 5: (Item No. 38 & 39)
Included: Open frame wall mount rack, 1-horizontal wire manager, 1-4x4 plywood
**CAT 6/CAT6A Includes: Jack, cable, faceplate, testing, labeling, raceway..NO Conduit.
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