
AWARDED VENDOR

BIDDERS
TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

WASTEWATER TABLE II

QTY 4- 1 YEAR CONTRACT $1,064.00 $1,700.00 $3,660.00

QTY 4- 2 YEAR CONTRACT $1,064.00 $1,700.00 $3,660.00

WASTEWATER TABLE III

QTY16  1 YEAR CONTRACT $3 040 00 $3 760 00 $5 120 00

LOCATION: LARGE CONFERENCE ROOM (2ND FLOOR)
BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 12, 2009 AT 11:00 A.M.

NO BID

NO BID

FRONTIER GEOSCIENCES

SEATTLE, WA

NO BID

ANALYSYS

AUSTIN, TX

$350.00

$1 440 00

UNIT PRICE

$350.00

PROJECT NO. 11-09-S05-48  ENVIRONMENTAL LABORATORY SERVICES

$90 00 $190 00

TTI ENVIRONMENTAL

ARLINGTON, TX
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

PACE ANALYTICAL

ST. ROSE, LA
UNIT PRICE

$266.00

$266.00

$1,400.00

$1,400.00

TOTAL PRICE

$915.00

$320 00

ANA-LAB

KILGORE, TX
UNIT PRICE

$915.00$425.00

$425.00

$235 00QTY16- 1 YEAR CONTRACT $3,040.00 $3,760.00 $5,120.00

QTY16- 2 YEAR CONTRACT $3,040.00 $3,760.00 $5,120.00

TOTAL CYANIDES

QTY MIN. 16/YR- 1 YEAR CONTRACT $480.00 $720.00 $576.00

QTY MIN. 16/YR- 2 YEAR CONTRACT $480.00 $720.00 $576.00

OIL & GREASE

QTY AS NEEDED-1 YEAR CONTRACT $35.00 $65.00 $42.00

QTY AS NEEDED-2 YEAR CONTRACT $35.00 $65.00 $42.00

TOTAL TOXIC ORGANICS

QTY AS NEEDED-1 YEAR CONTRACT $585.00 $425.00 $915.00

QTY AS NEEDED-2 YEAR CONTRACT $585.00 $425.00 $915.00

30 TAC CHAP 307

QTY 4-1 YEAR CONTRACT $2,800.00 $1,980.00 $7,444.00

QTY 4-2 YEAR CONTRACT $2,800.00 $1,980.00 $7,444.00SUBTOTAL LABORATORY 
ANALYSIS  - 1 YEAR  
CONTRACT

SUBTOTAL  LABORATORY 
ANALYSIS -2 YEAR CONTRACT 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$5,855.00

$30.00

$35.00

$35.00

$5,855.00 $8,650.00

$30.00

$425.00

$425.00

$495.00

$495.00

$8,650.00

$1,440.00

$1,440.00

$90.00

$90.00

$350.00

$350.00

$2,400.00

$2,400.00

$240.00

$240.00

$25.00

$25.00

$350.00

$350.00

$600.00

$600.00

$15.00

$15.00

$25.00

$25.00

$190.00

$190.00

$8,004.00

$8,004.00

$585.00

$585.00

$700.00

$700.00

$320.00

$320.00

$36.00

$1,861.00

$1,861.00

$17,757.00

$36.00

$42.00

$42.00

$915.00

$17,757.00

$235.00

$235.00

$45.00

$45.00

$65.00

$65.00

$915.00
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AWARDED VENDOR

BIDDERS

LOCATION: LARGE CONFERENCE ROOM (2ND FLOOR)
BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 12, 2009 AT 11:00 A.M.

FRONTIER GEOSCIENCES

SEATTLE, WA

ANALYSYS

AUSTIN, TX

PROJECT NO. 11-09-S05-48  ENVIRONMENTAL LABORATORY SERVICES

TTI ENVIRONMENTAL

ARLINGTON, TX

PACE ANALYTICAL

ST. ROSE, LA

ANA-LAB

KILGORE, TX

1 YEAR 2 YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR

SHIPPING & HANDLING $0.00 $0.00 $100.00 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00 $50.00 $50.00
CONTAINER COST $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO CHARGE NO CHARGE $0.00 $0.00
METALS DIGESTION $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $10.00 $16.00 $16.00
MERCURY DIGESTION $0 00 $0 00 $0 00 $0 00 $10 00 $10 00 $16 00 $16 00

COST INCLUDED IN PRICES BELOW

OTHER COSTS (1 OR 2 YEAR CONTRACT)

PACE WILL PAY FOR SHIPMENTS OVER 
$250.00

MERCURY DIGESTION $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $10.00 $16.00 $16.00

SUBTOTAL OTHER COSTS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $120.00 $170.00 $32.00 $32.00 $50.00 $50.00

QTY 1 YEAR TOTAL QTY 2 YEAR TOTAL QTY 1 YEAR ** TOTAL QTY 2 YEAR ** TOTAL QTY 1 YEAR TOTAL QTY 2 YEAR TOTAL QTY 1 YEAR TOTAL QTY 2 YEAR TOTAL QTY 1 YEAR TOTAL QTY 2 YEAR TOTAL

ARSENIC $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00 $0.00

CADMIUM $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00

CHROMIUM $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00

COPPER $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00

LEAD $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00

MERCURY $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $25.00 $0.00 0.00 $25.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $70.00 $0.00 0.00 $70.00

NICKEL $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00

SELENIUM $50.00 $0.00 0.00 $50.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $50.00 $0.00 0.00 $50.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $100.00 $0.00 0.00 $100.00

SILVER $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00

ZINC $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00

MOLYBDENUM $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $15.00 $0.00 0.00 $15.00 $0.00 $10.00 $0.00 0.00 $10.00 $0.00 $13.00 $0.00 0.00 $13.00 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00 0.00 $24.00

SUBTOTAL ADD'L ANALYSIS $150.00 $0.00 $150.00 $170.00 $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 $150.00 $150.00 $386.00 $386.00

1 YEAR 2 YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR
GRAND TOTAL: $6,005.00 $6,005.00 $8,174.00 $8,169.00 $8,935.00 $8,985.00 $17,939.00 $17,939.00 $436.00 $436.00
** SELENIUM - SUBCONTRACTED TO A CERTIFIED LAB

COSTS FOR ADDITIONAL ANALYSIS ON WASTEWATER SAMPLES (1 OR 2 YEAR CONTRACT)
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