
PROJECT NO.:  12-09-S10-109 CONCESSIONAIRE SERVICE CONTRACT

M.E.M. CONCESSIONS LUGO'S CONCESSION

BIDDERS: LA VILLA, TX MISSION, TX
PROPOSAL "A" -WESTSIDE PARK SOFTBALL COMPLEX
BASE PROPOSAL-ONE (1) YEAR
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $500.00 $9,000.00
ALTERNATE PROPOSAL-TO (2) YEARS
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $600.00 $9,250.00
PROPOSAL "B" - DE LEON SOCCER COMPLEX
BASE PROPOSAL-ONE (1) YEAR
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $300.00 $6,012.00
ALTERNATE PROPOSAL-TO (2) YEARS
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $400.00 $6,012.00
PROPOSAL "C" - BICENTENNIAL SOCCER COMPLEX
BASE PROPOSAL-ONE (1) YEAR
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $200.00
ALTERNATE PROPOSAL-TO (2) YEARS
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $250.00
PROPOSAL "D" - MUNICIPAL BALLPARK
BASE PROPOSAL-ONE (1) YEAR
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $500.00 $9,612.00
ALTERNATE PROPOSAL-TO (2) YEARS
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $550.00 $9,612.00
PROPOSAL "E"- MUNICIPAL SWIMMING POOL
BASE PROPOSAL-ONE (1) YEAR
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $200.00
ALTERNATE PROPOSAL-TO (2) YEARS
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $250.00
PROPOSAL "F"- LOS ENCINOS SWIMMING POOL
BASE PROPOSAL-ONE (1) YEAR
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $200.00
ALTERNATE PROPOSAL-TO (2) YEARS
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $250.00
PROPOSAL "G" - SUAREZ PARK
BASE PROPOSAL-ONE (1) YEAR
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $350.00
ALTERNATE PROPOSAL-TO (2) YEARS
UNIT PRICE/YEAR $400.00

NO BID

NO BID

BID OPENING: December 30, 2009 at 4:00 p.m.
LOCATION:  Large Conference Room 

NO BID

NO BID
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